
4 Season Home 

Services              

Aurora, IL         

Beary Landscape 

Management        

Lockport, IL

Brad Taylor Inc.         

Plainfield, IL

Cornerstone Partners     

St Charles, IL     

HL Landscape        

Joliet, IL

Landscape Concepts 

Management          

Grayslake, IL

Langton Group     

Woodstock, IL    

Local Lawn Care & 

Landscaping       

Naperville, IL

Ramiro Guzman 

Landscaping, Inc     

Plainfield, IL

Riley Lawn and 

Snow Service       

Aurora, IL

Serenity Landscape 

Group                  

Villa Park, IL 

Cost per Mow List A

2020 Cost 1,175.00$                  300.00$                     736.95$                     500.71$                     395.00$                     496.00$                     275.00$                     520.00$                     636.29$                     442.17$                     1,163.75$                  

2021 Cost 1,175.00$                  310.00$                     No Bid 500.71$                     395.00$                     508.00$                     275.00$                     520.00$                     636.29$                     442.17$                     1,163.75$                  

2022 Cost 1,230.00$                  320.00$                     No Bid 513.26$                     455.00$                     520.00$                     275.00$                     520.00$                     636.29$                     442.17$                     1,180.75$                  

Cost per Mow List B

2020 Cost 1,585.00$                  580.00$                     1,005.40$                  556.78$                     755.00$                     704.00$                     570.00$                     895.00$                     883.46$                     603.26$                     1,587.50$                  

2021 Cost 1,615.00$                  600.00$                     No Bid 556.78$                     755.00$                     718.00$                     570.00$                     895.00$                     883.46$                     603.26$                     1,587.50$                  

2022 Cost 1,650.00$                  620.00$                     No Bid 570.78$                     840.00$                     732.00$                     570.00$                     895.00$                     883.46$                     603.26$                     1,611.50$                  

List C

Unit Price to Mow per Sq/yd 0.12$                         0.03$                         0.05$                         0.05$                         1.75$                         0.035$                       $            67.00/Acre 30.000$                     0.0431$                     2.00$                         0.045$                       

Unit Price to Install City Supplied Mulch 55.00$                       35.00$                       100.00$                     37.75$                       45.00$                       38.00$                       38.00$                       50.00$                       27.00$                       40.00$                       80.00$                       

Total Price Shrub & Edging per Year 2,070.00$                  500.00$                     750.00$                     481.72$                     1,820.00$                  3,560.00$                  268.00$                     2,100.00$                  850.00$                     1,600.00$                  10,400.00$                

CITY OF AURORA

Bid Tabulation for 20-21

Downtown Mowing and Landscape Maintenance

FINAL
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