
Line Item Description

LED LIGHT FIXTURES AND LAMPS

Anzy Supply Inc.

Consolidated 
Electrical 

Distibutors
Crescent Electric 
Supply Company J.P. Simons & Co. Oxie Valley Electric Paramont EO Inc

Chicago, IL Naperville, IL Aurora, IL Glendale Heights, IL Aurora, IL Woodridge, IL
1 LED Cobra Head (eq to 150w) 120-277v, 4000 K, Tyll, 7 Pin Photocell 198.49$                    156.00$                    124.00$                    151.63$                       143.36$                    149.00$                    
2 LED Cobra Head (eq to 250w) 120-277v, 4000 K, Tyll, 7 Pin Photocell 257.00$                    179.00$                    130.00$                    199.26$                       175.00$                    162.00$                    
3 LED Cobra Head (eq to 310w) 120-277v, 4000 K, Tyll, 7 Pin Photocell 277.32$                    297.00$                    216.00$                    437.40$                       254.24$                    250.00$                    
4 LED Cobra Head (eq to 400w) 120-277v, 4000 K, Tyll, 7 Pin Photocell 295.18$                    317.00$                    226.00$                    437.40$                       265.44$                    262.00$                    
5 Eiko LED27WPT50KMOG-G5 No Bid 42.35$                      39.747$                    39.58$                         36.95$                      37.00$                      
6 Eiko LED45WPT50KMOG-G5 No Bid 51.25$                      48.181$                    47.98$                         44.79$                      44.00$                      

FUSES AND ACCESSORIES

7 MOL5-MOL 5 thru 30 or Equal No Bid No Bid 1.866$                      2.08$                           1.99$                        2.65$                        
MOL6 No Bid No Bid 1.866$                      2.08$                           1.99$                        2.65$                        
MOL7 No Bid No Bid 1.889$                      No Bid No Bid No Bid
MOL8 No Bid No Bid 1.889$                      No Bid No Bid No Bid
MOL9 No Bid No Bid 1.889$                      No Bid No Bid No Bid
MOL10 No Bid No Bid 1.653$                      2.08$                           1.76$                        2.65$                        
MOL12 No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.08$                           2.01$                        2.65$                        
MOL15 No Bid No Bid 1.712$                      2.08$                           1.83$                        2.65$                        
MOL20 No Bid No Bid 1.653$                      2.08$                           2.08$                        2.65$                        
MOL25 No Bid No Bid 1.836$                      2.08$                           2.19$                        2.65$                        
MOL30 No Bid No Bid 1.653$                      2.08$                           1.76$                        2.65$                        

8 HEB AA Fuse Holder No Bid No Bid 4.504$                      8.11$                           6.09$                        9.75$                        
9 HEB AB Fuse Holder No Bid No Bid 5.557$                      8.65$                           17.16$                      14.75$                      

10 HEB AW RLC-A Fuse Holder No Bid No Bid 13.962$                    13.89$                         27.12$                      34.00$                      
11 HEX AA Fuse Holder No Bid No Bid 17.075$                    32.78$                         1.40$                        54.00$                      
12 2A0660 Insulated Boot No Bid No Bid 1.163$                      3.04$                           No Bid 2.55$                        
13 ECNR5-FRN R 5 thru 100 or Equal No Bid 12.50$                      3.254$                      10.21$                         4.83$                        12.25$                      

ECNR6 No Bid 12.50$                      3.254$                      10.21$                         4.83$                        12.25$                      
ECNR7 No Bid 12.50$                      3.254$                      10.21$                         4.83$                        12.25$                      
ECNR8 No Bid 12.50$                      3.254$                      10.21$                         4.83$                        12.25$                      
ECNR9 No Bid 12.50$                      3.254$                      10.21$                         4.83$                        12.25$                      
ECNR10 No Bid 12.50$                      2.745$                      10.21$                         4.08$                        12.25$                      
ECNR12 No Bid 12.50$                      2.872$                      10.21$                         4.26$                        12.25$                      
ECNR15 No Bid 12.50$                      2.205$                      10.21$                         3.28$                        12.25$                      
ECNR17.5 No Bid 12.50$                      No Bid 10.21$                         3.50$                        12.25$                      
ECNR20 No Bid 12.50$                      2.205$                      10.21$                         3.28$                        12.25$                      
ECNR25 No Bid 12.50$                      2.205$                      10.21$                         3.28$                        12.25$                      
ECNR30 No Bid 12.50$                      2.205$                      10.21$                         3.28$                        12.25$                      
ECNR35 No Bid 12.50$                      4.029$                      10.21$                         5.98$                        12.25$                      
ECNR40 No Bid 12.50$                      4.029$                      10.21$                         5.98$                        12.25$                      
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ECNR45 No Bid 12.50$                      4.029$                      10.21$                         5.98$                        12.25$                      
ECNR50 No Bid 12.50$                      4.029$                      10.21$                         5.98$                        12.25$                      
ECNR60 No Bid 12.50$                      4.029$                      10.21$                         5.98$                        12.25$                      
ECNR70 No Bid 12.50$                      9.118$                      10.21$                         13.53$                      12.25$                      
ECNR75 No Bid 12.50$                      No Bid 10.21$                         17.39$                      12.25$                      
ECNR80 No Bid 12.50$                      9.118$                      10.21$                         13.53$                      12.25$                      
ECNR90 No Bid 12.50$                      No Bid 10.21$                         13.53$                      12.25$                      
ECNR100 No Bid 12.50$                      9.118$                      10.21$                         13.53$                      12.25$                      

14 ECSR5-FRS R 5 thru 100 or Equal No Bid 17.25$                      5.533$                      19.41$                         8.22$                        22.00$                      
ECSR6 No Bid 17.25$                      5.533$                      19.41$                         8.22$                        22.00$                      
ECSR7 No Bid 17.25$                      5.826$                      19.41$                         8.65$                        22.00$                      
ECSR8 No Bid 17.25$                      5.533$                      19.41$                         8.22$                        22.00$                      
ECSR9 No Bid 17.25$                      5.826$                      19.41$                         8.65$                        22.00$                      
ECSR10 No Bid 17.25$                      5.533$                      19.41$                         8.22$                        22.00$                      
ECSR12 No Bid 17.25$                      5.533$                      19.41$                         8.22$                        22.00$                      
ECSR15 No Bid 17.25$                      4.889$                      19.41$                         7.25$                        22.00$                      
ECSR17.5 No Bid 17.25$                      No Bid 19.41$                         7.25$                        22.00$                      
ECSR20 No Bid 17.25$                      4.889$                      19.41$                         7.25$                        22.00$                      
ECSR25 No Bid 17.25$                      4.889$                      19.41$                         7.25$                        22.00$                      
ECSR30 No Bid 17.25$                      4.889$                      19.41$                         7.25$                        22.00$                      
ECSR35 No Bid 17.25$                      8.386$                      19.41$                         12.44$                      22.00$                      
ECSR40 No Bid 17.25$                      8.386$                      19.41$                         12.44$                      22.00$                      
ECSR45 No Bid 17.25$                      8.386$                      19.41$                         12.44$                      22.00$                      
ECSR50 No Bid 17.25$                      8.386$                      19.41$                         12.44$                      22.00$                      
ECSR60 No Bid 17.25$                      8.386$                      19.41$                         12.44$                      22.00$                      
ECSR70 No Bid 17.25$                      17.330$                    19.41$                         25.72$                      22.00$                      
ECSR75 No Bid 17.25$                      No Bid 19.41$                         28.95$                      22.00$                      
ECSR80 No Bid 17.25$                      17.330$                    19.41$                         25.72$                      22.00$                      
ECSR90 No Bid 17.25$                      17.330$                    19.41$                         25.72$                      22.00$                      
ECSR100 No Bid 17.25$                      17.330$                    19.41$                         25.72$                      22.00$                      

SPLICING

15 T&B YS8C Crimp Sleeve No Bid No Bid 1.651$                      1.50$                           2.10$                        2.95$                        
16 T&B YS6C Crimp Sleeve No Bid No Bid 3.276$                      2.65$                           2.27$                        5.75$                        
17 T&B YS4C Crimp Sleeve No Bid No Bid 3.978$                      2.99$                           2.71$                        6.95$                        
18 T&B YS2C Crimp Sleeve No Bid No Bid 4.836$                      3.40$                           3.28$                        8.25$                        
19 T&B HS16-12-L Shrink Tube No Bid No Bid 4.884$                      1.29$                           3.00$                        5.00$                        
20 T&B HS12-6-L Shrink Tube No Bid No Bid 5.046$                      1.33$                           3.25$                        5.25$                        
21 T&B HS6-1-L Shrink Tube No Bid No Bid 5.629$                      5.60$                           3.25$                        5.75$                        
22 T&B HSC2-20 Shrink Cap No Bid No Bid 6.328$                      5.20$                           6.85$                        5.80$                        

* Go Green LED Alternatives LLC Bid Received considered Non Compliant.
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