
Bid Tabulation - Same OPIS

WEDNESDAY, OCTOBER 16, 2019 @ 3 PM

OPIS $1.7195 OPIS $1.8664 OPIS $2.3285 OPIS $2.0512 OPIS $1.8664 OPIS $2.3310 

OPIS + Markup OPIS + Markup OPIS + Markup OPIS + Markup OPIS + Markup OPIS + Markup

TOTAL PRICE/GAL TOTAL PRICE/GAL TOTAL PRICE/GAL TOTAL PRICE/GAL TOTAL PRICE/GAL TOTAL PRICE/GAL

Mansfield Oil - Gainsville, GA $0.0513 $1.7708 $0.0639 $1.9303 $0.0296 $2.3581 $0.0343 $2.0855 $0.6234 $2.4898 $0.7169 $3.0479

Petroleum Traders - Fort Wayne, IN $0.0269 $1.7464 $0.4530 $2.3194 $0.0564 $2.3849 $0.0564 $2.1076 $0.7590 $2.6254 $0.7590 $3.0900

Heritage Petroleum - Evansville, IN $0.0600 $1.7795 $0.0600 $1.9264 $0.0600 $2.3885 $0.0600 $2.1112 $0.7000 $2.5664 $0.8000 $3.1310

Blu Petroleum, Inc - Mundelein, IL $0.0490 $1.7685 $0.0690 $1.9354 $0.0690 $2.3975 $0.0690 $2.1202 $0.1500 $2.0164 $0.1500 $2.4810

Al Warren Oil Co., Inc - Hammond, IN $0.0500 $1.7695 $0.0500 $1.9164 $0.0700 $2.3985 $0.0600 $2.1112 $1.0000 $2.8664 $1.0000 $3.3310

Feece Oil Co. -  Minooka, IL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

OPIS $1.7195 OPIS $1.8664 OPIS $1.8714 OPIS $1.7195 
OPIS + Markup OPIS + Markup OPIS + Markup OPIS + Markup

TOTAL PRICE/GAL TOTAL PRICE/GAL TOTAL PRICE/GAL TOTAL PRICE/GAL

Mansfield Oil - Gainsville, GA $0.3527 $2.0722 $0.5695 $2.4359 $1.4792 $3.3506 $0.5344 $2.2539

Petroleum Traders - Fort Wayne, IN $0.2580 $1.9775 $0.2580 $2.1244 $0.5590 $2.4304 $0.3590 $2.0785

Heritage Petroleum - Evansville, IN $0.3000 $2.0195 $0.3000 $2.1664 $0.7500 $2.6214 $0.7500 $2.4695

Blu Petroleum, Inc - Mundelein, IL $0.1300 $1.8495 $0.1500 $2.0164 $0.1500 $2.0214 $0.1300 $1.8495

Feece Oil Co. -  Minooka, IL $0.1350 $1.8545 $0.1350 $2.0014 $0.1350 $2.0064 $0.1350 $1.8545

Al Warren Oil Co., Inc - Hammond, IN $0.2000 $1.9195 $0.2000 $2.0664 $1.0000 $2.8714 $1.0000 $2.7195

INTERGOVERNMENTAL UNITS

OPIS $1.7195 OPIS $1.7195 OPIS $1.8664 OPIS $1.8664 OPIS $2.3285 OPIS $2.3285 
OPIS + Markup OPIS + Markup OPIS + Markup OPIS + Markup OPIS + Markup OPIS + Markup

TOTAL PRICE/GAL TOTAL PRICE/GAL TOTAL PRICE/GAL TOTAL PRICE/GAL TOTAL PRICE/GAL TOTAL PRICE/GAL

Mansfield Oil - Gainsville, GA $0.6394 $2.3589 $0.0866 $1.8061 $0.6295 $2.4959 $0.0801 $1.9465 $0.9221 $3.2506 $0.0461 $2.37460

Petroleum Traders - Fort Wayne, IN $0.3590 $2.0785 $0.0296 $1.7491 $0.2580 $2.1244 $0.0453 $1.9117 $0.7590 $3.0875 $0.0564 $2.3849

Blu Petroleum, Inc - Mundelein, IL $0.1300 $1.8495 $0.0490 $1.7685 $0.1500 $2.0164 $0.0690 $1.9354 $0.1500 $2.4785 $0.0690 $2.3975

Al Warren Oil Co., Inc - Hammond, IN $0.7500 $2.4695 $0.0500 $1.7695 $0.7500 $2.6164 $0.0500 $1.9164 $0.7500 $3.0785 $0.0700 $2.3985

Heritage Petroleum - Evansville, IN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Feece Oil Co. -  Minooka, IL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

** Same OPIS report dated 10/11/2019  **

(#2) Non-Road Diesel Fuel - 

50% -50% Winter Blend

45-019 GASOLINE

VENDOR

GENERATORS: Bio Diesel Fuel 

#2 (B5) Fuel Pre-Blend Winter 

50% #1 50% #2 Multi-Location - 

Tank Wagon

GENERATORS: Bio Diesel Fuel 

#2 (B5) Multi-Location - Tank 

Wagon

REGULAR GASOLINE - Multi-

Location City of Aurora, DOT, 

and Sheriff

Diesel - Winter Blend 50% #1 

clear - 50% #2 - KDOT

Bio Diesel Fuel #2 - PreBlend 

Winter 20% #1 - 80% #2 - City of 

Aurora

MARKUP MARKUP MARKUP

Bio Diesel Fuel #2 (B5) Multi-

Location - KDOT & City of 

Aurora

(#1) - GASOLINE (#3) - Bio Diesel #2 - B5 (#5) - 50% -50% Winter Blend

MARKUPMARKUP

GENERATOR: Bio Diesel Fuel 

#2 (B5) - City of Aurora - Tank 

Wagon

REGULAR GASOLINE - 

AIRPORT, City of Aurora.  Tank 

Wagon

(#3) Bio Diesel #2 - B5 (#4) GASOLINE

WAGGON DELIVERY - Generators & Airport (City of Auroa)WAGGON DELIVERY - Aboveground Tank (FP)

MARKUP

(#6) - Winter Blend Diesel - 

20% - 80% Winter Blend

(#1) - Non-Road Diesel Fuel #2 - 

B5

TANK DELIVERY (7000 - 10000 

GALLONS)

MARKUP

VENDOR

(#2) GASOLINE (#4) - Bio Diesel #2 - (B5)

VENDOR MARKUP

WAGGON DELIVERY (200 - 5000 

GALLONS)

REGULAR GASOLINE - TANK 

WAGGON (Forest Preserve)

Bio Diesel Fuel #2 (B5) - (Forest 

Preserve)

(A) GASOLINE

MARKUPMARKUP

(B) Bio Diesel Fuel #2 (B5) (C) 50% -50% Winter Blend

MARKUP MARKUPMARKUP MARKUP

WAGGON DELIVERY (200 - 5000 

GALLONS)

TANK DELIVERY (7000 - 10000 

GALLONS)

WAGON DELIVERY (200 - 5000 

GALLONS)

TANK DELIVERY (7000 - 10000 

GALLONS)

MARKUP MARKUP


