Denotes lowest bid

Bid Tabulation
City of Aurora Water & Sewer
Maintenance Division
2022 Materials and Supplies

Denotes lowest bid which should be used because it was submitted by a qualified Aurora company that meets the Local Preference Ordinance 020-029.
The qualified bidder's original price was less than 5% more than the lowest submitted price and bidder has agreed to match the lowest submitted price. (Mid American Water, Inc. only qualified local vendor)

Core and Main LP

Ferguson Waterworks

Mid American Water, Inc.

Underground Pipe &

Water Products Company

Ziebell Water Service

Water & Sewer 2022 Materials and Supplies 220'S. Westgate Dr 1720 State Street 1500 E. Mountain St. - A":L":&gggé o 3255 E. New York St. zggold::;; ;‘fd Notes
Carol Stream, IL 60188 Dekalb, IL 60115 Aurora, IL 60505 Shorewood, IL 60404 Aurora, IL 60504 Elk Grove Village, IL
NO. [ITEM UNIT UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST
Fire Hydrants & Related Parts
1 |Waterous Fire Hydrant Assembly, 4 1/2' Bury EA $2,918.00 - $3,905.00 - - $3,050.00
2 [Waterous Fire Hydrant Assembly, 5' Bury EA $2,984.00 - $2,970.00 - - $3,120.00
3 |Waterous Fire Hydrant Assembly, 5 1/2' Bury EA $3,050.00 - $3,035.00 - - $3,190.00
4 |Waterous Fire Hydrant Assembly, 6' Bury EA $3,116.50 - $3,100.00 - - $3,300.00
5 |Waterous Fire Hydrant Assembly, 4 1/2' Bury w/Alpha Standard Base EA $3,444.00 - $2,965.00 - - $3,195.00
6 |Waterous Fire Hydrant Assembly, 5' Bury w/Alpha Standard Base EA $3,766.00 - $3,030.00 - - $3,275.00
7 |Waterous Fire Hydrant Assembly, 5 1/2' Bury w/Alpha Standard Base EA $3,832.50 - $3,095.00 - - $3,350.00
8 |Waterous Fire Hydrant Assembly, 6' Bury w/Alpha Standard Base EA $3,898.00 - $3,160.00 - - $3,450.00
9 |Waterous Fire Hydrant Assembly, 4 1/2' Bury w/Alpha XL Base EA $3,444.00 - $2,965.00 - - $3,195.00
10 [Waterous Fire Hydrant Assembly, 5' Bury w/Alpha XL Base EA $3,766.00 - $3,030.00 - - $3,275.00
11 [Waterous Fire Hydrant Assembly, 5 1/2' Bury w/Alpha XL Base EA $3,832.50 - $3,095.00 - - $3,350.00
12 [Waterous Fire Hydrant Assembly, 6' Bury w/Alpha XL Base EA $3,898.00 - $3,160.00 - - $3,450.00
13 |Waterous Fire Hydrant Extension, 6" EA $607.00 - $575.00* - $575.00 $640.00 Use local bid
14 |Waterous Fire Hydrant Extension, 12" EA $714.50 - $677.00* - $677.00 $750.00 Use local bid
15 |Waterous Fire Hydrant Extension, 18" EA $829.50 - $786.00* - $786.00 $825.00 Use local bid
16 |Waterous Fire Hydrant Extension, 24" EA $938.00 - $889.00* - $889.00 $990.00 Use local bid
17 |Waterous Traffic Kit, Old Style (K525/10") EA $342.50 - $329.00 - $342.00 $350.00
18 |Waterous Traffic Kit, New Style (K528/16") EA $280.50 - $269.00 - $455.00 $290.00
19 [Waterous Hydrant Kit K834, Hydrant Head w/Traffic Kit EA $3,106.50 - - - - $3,195.00
20 |Waterous Hydrant Kit K836, Hydrant Head EA $1,543.50 - - - - $1,700.00
21 |Waterous Hydrant Part #60 (Hydrant Head) EA $642.50 - - - - $650.00
22 |RoDon Hydra-Finder Hydrant Marker, 60" EA $20.50 - - $22.00 $17.95 $35.00
23 [Drain Plunger #7 EA $20.00 - $18.50 - $21.50 $20.00
24 [Nozzle Cap Hose #10 EA $133.50 - $107.00 - $124.70 $116.00
25 [Nozzle Cap Pumper #10 EA $195.50 - $184.00 - $215.00 $200.00
26 [Cap Gasket Hose #11 EA $8.00 - $7.50 - $8.60 $8.00
27 [Cap Gasket Pumper #11 EA $11.00 - $10.00 - $11.83 $11.00
28 [Nozzle - Hose #12 EA $135.00 - $126.00 - $148.35 $138.00
29 [Nozzle - Pumper #12 EA $383.50 - $360.00 - $421.40 $392.00
30 |Lower Operating Nut #17A EA $43.00 - $41.00 - $47.30 $44.00
31 |Upper Operating Nut #17B EA $78.50 - $74.00 - $100.00 $80.00
32 |Crossarm #30 EA $83.50 - $78.00 - $91.38 $85.00
33 [Valve Seat #31 EA $239.50 - $225.00 - $263.38 $245.00
34 |Upper Valve Washer #34 EA $29.50 - $28.00 - $91.38 $85.00 Investigate cost difference
35 [Main Valve Rubber #35 EA $78.50 - $74.00 - $86.00 $80.00
36 |Lower Valve Washer #36 EA $44.00 - $41.00 - $48.38 $45.00




Denotes lowest bid

Bid Tabulation
City of Aurora Water & Sewer
Maintenance Division
2022 Materials and Supplies

Denotes lowest bid which should be used because it was submitted by a qualified Aurora company that meets the Local Preference Ordinance 020-029.

The qualified bidder's original price was less than 5% more than the lowest submitted price and bidder has agreed to match the lowest submitted price. (Mid American Water, Inc. only qualified local vendor)

Core and Main LP

Ferguson Waterworks

Mid American Water, Inc.

Underground Pipe &

Water Products Company

Ziebell Water Service

Water & Sewer 2022 Materials and Supplies 220'S. Westgate Dr 1720 State Street 1500 E. Mountain St. - A":L":&gggé o 3255 E. New York St. zggold::;; ;‘fd Notes
Carol Stream, IL 60188 Dekalb, IL 60115 Aurora, IL 60505 Shorewood, IL 60404 Aurora, IL 60504 Elk Grove Village, IL
NO. |ITEM UNIT UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST
37 |O-Ring (Support wheel), 1-1/8 x 1-3/8 #59 EA $3.00 - $3.00 - $3.23 $3.00 Use local bid
38 |Flange Lock Ring #64 EA $10.00 - $10.00 - $10.75 $10.00 Use local bid
39 |Coupling Sleeve (2 halves) #67 EA $15.00 - $28.00 - $16.13 $30.00 Investigate cost difference
40 |O-Ring (Lower tube seal), 1-7/8 x 2-1/8 #83 EA $3.00 - $3.00 - $3.23 $3.00 Use local bid
41 [Support Wheel Gasket #84 EA $3.00 - $3.00 - $3.23 $3.00 Use local bid
42 |Brass Lock Nuts #87 EA $5.00 - $5.00 - $5.38 $5.00 Use local bid
43 |Nozzle Section Bushing Assembly #89 EA $34.50 - $32.00 - $37.63 $57.00
44 Thrust Ring #90 EA $8.00 - $8.00 - $8.60 $8.00 Use local bid
45 |Upper Standpipe Gasket #92 EA $12.00 - $11.00 - $12.90 $12.00
46 |Breakable Flange #113 EA $64.00 - $60.00 - $69.88 $65.00
47 |O-Ring (Pumper Nozzle) 5-1/4 X 5-5/8 #116 EA $12.00 - $11.00 - $12.90 $12.00
48 |Pumper Nozzle Retainer #117 EA $35.50 - $33.00 - $38.70 $36.00
49 |O-Ring (Hose Nozzle) 3-1/4 X 3-5/8 #118 EA $11.00 - $10.00 - $11.83 $11.00
50 |Hose Nozzle Retainer #119 EA $25.50 - $24.00 - $27.95 $26.00
51 [T-Bolts and Nuts (Per Case) EA $231.50 - $275.00 - $247.50 $243.75
52 [High Performance Grease for Food Processing Equipment (6-1/2 Oz) EA $34.50 - - - $38.00 $200.00
53 [Mineral Oil Lubricant (5 Gal) EA $58.00 - - - - $39.00
Valves and Related Parts
54 |Clow Cutting in Valve, 2" EA - - - - - - No Bid
55 |Clow Cutting in Valve, 4" EA - - - $714.00 $844.00 -
56 |Clow Cutting in Valve, 6" EA - - - $975.00 $1,149.00 -
57 |Clow Cutting in Valve, 8" EA - - - $1,517.00 $1,780.00 -
58 [Clow Cutting in Valve, 10" EA - - - $2,176.00 $2,636.00 -
59 [Clow Cutting in Valve, 12" EA - - - $2,746.00 $3,327.00 -
60 |American Flow Control Gate Valve, 2" w/ Mechanical Joint Ends EA $378.50 - $329.00 - - $375.00
61 |American Flow Control Gate Valve, 4" w/ Mechanical Joint Ends EA $530.00 - $506.00* - $506.00 $590.00 Use local bid
62 |American Flow Control Gate Valve, 6" w/ Mechanical Joint Ends EA $676.50 - $646.00* - $646.00 $750.00 Use local bid
63 |American Flow Control Gate Valve, 8" w/ Mechanical Joint Ends EA $1,076.50 - $1,029.00* - $1,029.00 $1,280.00 Use local bid
64 |American Flow Control Gate Valve, 10" w/ Mechanical Joint Ends EA $1,678.00 - $1,605.00* - $1,605.00 $1,850.00 Use local bid
65 |American Flow Control Gate Valve, 12" w/ Mechanical Joint Ends EA $2,123.00 - $2,030.00* - $2,030.00 $2,340.00 Use local bid
66 |American Flow Control Gate Valve, 14" w/ Mechanical Joint Ends EA $3,529.50 - - - POA? $7,500.00
67 |American Flow Control Gate Valve, 16" w/ Mechanical Joint Ends EA $3,107.00 - - - POA? $7,800.00
68 |American Flow Control Gate Valve, 2" w/ ALPHA Standard Restrained Joint Ends EA - - - - - - No Bid
69 |American Flow Control Gate Valve, 4" w/ ALPHA Standard Restrained Joint Ends EA $627.50 - $611.00 - - $725.00
70 |American Flow Control Gate Valve, 6" w/ ALPHA Standard Restrained Joint Ends EA $807.00 - $785.00 - - $895.00
71 |American Flow Control Gate Valve, 8" w/ ALPHA Standard Restrained Joint Ends EA $1,228.50 - $1,195.00 - - $1,445.00




Denotes lowest bid

Bid Tabulation
City of Aurora Water & Sewer
Maintenance Division
2022 Materials and Supplies

Denotes lowest bid which should be used because it was submitted by a qualified Aurora company that meets the Local Preference Ordinance 020-029.
The qualified bidder's original price was less than 5% more than the lowest submitted price and bidder has agreed to match the lowest submitted price. (Mid American Water, Inc. only qualified local vendor)

Core and Main LP

Ferguson Waterworks

Mid American Water, Inc.

Underground Pipe &

Water Products Company

Ziebell Water Service

. . . Valve, Co. Products, Inc.
Water & Sewer 2022 Materials and Supplies 220'S. Westgate Dr 1720 State Street 1500 E. Mountain St. - Amae": do;’ o 3255 E. New York St. ) 02101 :rca:t B’:‘f . Notes
Carol Stream, IL 60188 Dekalb, IL 60115 Aurora, IL 60505 ge ur. Aurora, IL 60504 ) |
Shorewood, IL 60404 Elk Grove Village, IL
NO. |ITEM UNIT UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST
72 |American Flow Control Gate Valve, 10" w/ ALPHA Standard Restrained Joint Ends EA $1,910.50 - $1,864.00 - - $2,100.00
73 |American Flow Control Gate Valve, 12" w/ ALPHA Standard Restrained Joint Ends EA $2,188.50 - $2,349.00 - - $2,650.00
74 |American Flow Control Gate Valve, 14" w/ ALPHA Standard Restrained Joint Ends EA - - - - - - No Bid
75 |American Flow Control Gate Valve, 16" w/ ALPHA Standard Restrained Joint Ends EA - - - - - - No Bid
76 |American Flow Control Gate Valve, 2" w/ ALPHA XL Restrained Joint Ends EA - - - - - - No Bid
77 |American Flow Control Gate Valve, 4" w/ ALPHA XL Restrained Joint Ends EA $627.50 - $597.00* - $597.00 $725.00 Use local bid
78 |American Flow Control Gate Valve, 6" w/ ALPHA XL Restrained Joint Ends EA $807.00 - $766.00* - $766.00 $895.00 Use local bid
79 |American Flow Control Gate Valve, 8" w/ ALPHA XL Restrained Joint Ends EA $1,228.50 - $1,170.00* - $1,170.00 $1,445.00 Use local bid
80 [American Flow Control Gate Valve, 10" w/ ALPHA XL Restrained Joint Ends EA $1,910.50 - $1,784.00* - $1,784.00 $2,100.00 Use local bid
81 [American Flow Control Gate Valve, 12" w/ ALPHA XL Restrained Joint Ends EA $2,188.50 - $2,295.00* - $2,295.00 $2,650.00 Use local bid
82 [American Flow Control Gate Valve, 14" w/ ALPHA XL Restrained Joint Ends EA - - - - POA? - No Bid
83 [American Flow Control Gate Valve, 16" w/ ALPHA XL Restrained Joint Ends EA - - - - POA? - No Bid
84 [Tyler Valve Box, 664-S Complete w/Lid EA $218.50 $207.27 $204.00* $204.00 $225.00 $230.00 Use local bid
85 |Tyler Valve Box Extension, #58-A EA $59.00 $63.05 $59.00 $59.00 $67.00 $75.00 Use local bid
86 |Tyler Valve Box Extension, #59-A EA $70.50 $75.14 $70.00 $70.00 $80.00 $80.00 Use local bid
87 |Tyler Valve Box Extension, #60-A EA $71.00 $76.00 $71.00 $71.00 $82.00 $90.00 Use local bid
88 [Tyler Valve Box Extension, #69A - 9" EA $60.00 $63.91 $60.00 $60.00 $65.00 $75.00 Use local bid
89 [Tyler Valve Box Extension, #69A - 18" (Foreign OK) EA $70.50 - $60.00 - $42.00 -
90 [Tyler Valve Box Extension, #69A - 24" (Foreign OK) EA $62.00 - $70.00 $65.00 $49.00 -
Repair Parts and Fittings
91 4" Non-Shear Mission Coupling (Clay to Plastic) EA $31.00 $35.21 $30.00 $28.28 $30.00
92 6" Non-Shear Mission Coupling (Clay to Plastic) EA $52.00 $59.70 $53.00 $47.96 $47.00
93 8" Non-Shear Mission Coupling (Clay to Plastic) EA $59.50 $67.90 $65.00 $54.55 $55.00
94 [10" Non-Shear Mission Coupling (Clay to Plastic) EA $77.00 $88.33 $85.00 $70.96 $65.00
95 [12" Non-Shear Mission Coupling (Clay to Plastic) EA $94.50 $108.13 $105.00 $86.87 $80.00
— ) B Underground Pipe noted
96 15" Non-Shear Mission Coupling (Clay to Plastic) EA $178.00 $204.16 $185.00 $164.01 $145.00 price subject to change so
97 |4" Non-Shear Mission Coupling (Plastic to Plastic) EA $21.00 $24.01 $25.00 $19.29 $30.00 may need to switch to
2nd lowest bidder
98 6" Non-Shear Mission Coupling (Plastic to Plastic) EA $40.00 $45.74 $42.00 $36.75 $47.00
99 8" Non-Shear Mission Coupling (Plastic to Plastic) EA $59.50 $67.90 $50.00 $54.55 $55.00
100 |10" Non-Shear Mission Coupling (Plastic to Plastic) EA $92.50 $88.33 $84.00 $70.96 $65.00
101 |12" Non-Shear Mission Coupling (Plastic to Plastic) EA $94.50 $108.13 $100.00 $86.87 $80.00
102 |15" Non-Shear Mission Coupling (Plastic to Plastic) EA $161.00 $184.77 $170.00 $148.44 $145.00
103 [2" x 8" Repair Clamp EA $47.00 $43.58 $50.00 $43.25 $66.96 $50.00
104 (4" x 8" Repair Clamp EA $60.00 $53.66 $71.00 $53.25 $85.56 $63.00
105 (6" x 8" Repair Clamp EA $70.00 $64.24 $74.00 $62.75 $101.68 $71.00




Denotes lowest bid

Bid Tabulation
City of Aurora Water & Sewer
Maintenance Division
2022 Materials and Supplies

Denotes lowest bid which should be used because it was submitted by a qualified Aurora company that meets the Local Preference Ordinance 020-029.
The qualified bidder's original price was less than 5% more than the lowest submitted price and bidder has agreed to match the lowest submitted price. (Mid American Water, Inc. only qualified local vendor)

Core and Main LP Ferguson Waterworks Mid American Water, Inc. Unde:irlt‘)/:ngol’ipe & Water Products Company Zieb:::):f:ér ISnecrvice
Water & Sewer 2022 Materials and Supplies 220S. Westgate Dr 1720 State Street 1500 E. Mountain St. 211 Amem;lodée or. 3255 E. New York St. 2001 Pratty Blv&. Notes
Carol Stream, IL 60188 Dekalb, IL 60115 Aurora, IL 60505 Shorewood, IL 60404 Aurora, IL 60504 Elk Grove Village, IL
NO. |ITEM UNIT UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST
106 |6" x 8" Repair Clamp w/ 3/4" Tap EA $95.00 $79.46 $95.00 $78.75 $140.12 $119.00
107 |6" x 8" Repair Clamp w/ 1" Tap EA $95.00 $79.46 $95.00 $78.75 $140.12 $119.00
108 (6" x 10" Repair Clamp EA $94.50 $85.29 $96.00 $76.00 $133.30 $98.00
109 (6" x 12" Repair Clamp EA $111.50 $110.54 $109.00 $89.75 $155.62 $118.00
110 |6" x 24" Repair Clamp EA $241.50 $238.54 $125.00 $212.50 $334.80 $295.00 Investigate cost difference
111 (6" x 36" Repair Clamp EA $703.00 $363.88 $419.00 $324.00 $624.52 $525.00
112 (8" x 8" Repair Clamp EA $81.50 $83.62 $84.00 $74.50 $115.32 $87.00
113 |8" x 8" Repair Clamp w/ 3/4" Tap EA $107.00 $100.59 $111.00 $89.75 $153.76 $129.00
114 |8" x 8" Repair Clamp w/ 1" Tap EA $107.00 $100.59 $111.00 $89.75 $153.76 $129.00
115 (8" x 10" Repair Clamp EA $107.50 $110.75 $105.00 $98.75 $151.28 $119.00
116 (8" x 12" Repair Clamp EA $130.00 $118.41 $118.00 $105.50 $182.90 $138.00
117 (8" x 16" Repair Clamp EA $149.50 $135.29 $145.00 $120.50 $229.40 $173.00
118 (8" x 24" Repair Clamp EA $271.00 $270.49 $250.00* $241.00 $378.20 $329.00 Use local bid
119 |8" x 36" Repair Clamp EA $750.50 $433.55 $480.00 $386.00 $697.62 $569.00 Investigate cost difference
120 |10" x 8" Repair Clamp w/ 3/4" Tap EA $107.00 $134.21 - $119.50 $191.05 $210.00
121 10" x 8" Repair Clamp w/ 1" Tap EA $107.00 $134.21 - $119.50 $191.05 $210.00
122 (10" x 10" Repair Clamp EA $139.50 $125.04 $140.00 $111.50 $210.00 $148.00
123 (10" x 12" Repair Clamp EA $166.00 $146.60 $159.00 $130.75 $251.10 $176.00
124 (10" x 16" Repair Clamp EA $192.50 $177.25 $183.00 $158.00 $508.00 $205.00
125 (10" x 24" Repair Clamp EA $327.00 $294.10 - $262.00 $746.00 $379.00
126 |12" x 8" Repair Clamp w/ 3/4" Tap EA $151.00 $136.14 - $121.25 $235.00 $245.00
127 |12" x 8" Repair Clamp w/ 1" Tap EA $151.00 $136.14 - $121.25 $235.00 $245.00
128 12" x 12" Repair Clamp EA $201.00 $178.77 $189.00 $159.25 $275.28 $210.00
129 12" x 16" Repair Clamp EA $228.50 $202.14 $207.00 $180.00 $355.26 $247.00
130 [12" x 24" Repair Clamp EA $374.00 $326.89 - $291.25 $522.04 $419.00
131 [12" x 36" Repair Clamp EA $1,098.50 $537.88 $600.00 $479.00 $1,021.26 $845.00
132 |4" Tyler Cut in Sleeve EA $244.00 $554.98 $510.00 $503.00 $565.00 $575.00 Investigate cost difference
133 |6" Tyler Cut in Sleeve EA $336.50 $739.67 $687.00 $670.00 $754.00 $725.00 Investigate cost difference
134 |8" Tyler Cut in Sleeve EA $437.00 $957.07 $888.00 $867.00 $975.00 $905.00 Investigate cost difference
135 |10" Tyler Cut in Sleeve EA $552.50 $1,174.47 $1,090.00 $1,064.00 $1,197.00 $1,120.00 Investigate cost difference|
136 |12" Tyler Cut in Sleeve EA $648.50 $1,563.30 $1,452.00 $1,416.00 $1,592.00 $1,475.00 Investigate cost difference|
137 (4" Full Body MJ Ductile Iron Solid Sleeve EA $159.50 - $267.00 $167.00 $186.00 $260.00
138 (6" Full Body MJ Ductile Iron Solid Sleeve EA $222.00 - $340.00 $229.00 $260.00 $320.00
139 (8" Full Body MJ Ductile Iron Solid Sleeve EA $286.00 - $429.00 $294.00 $332.00 $395.00
140 (10" Full Body MJ Ductile Iron Solid Sleeve EA $418.50 - $570.00 $429.00 $478.00 $580.00
141 (12" Full Body MJ Ductile Iron Solid Sleeve EA $553.00 - $1,164.00 $565.00 $634.00 $775.00
142 (14" Full Body MJ Ductile Iron Solid Sleeve EA $803.50 - - $1,328.00 $1,520.00 $1,590.00




Denotes lowest bid

Bid Tabulation
City of Aurora Water & Sewer
Maintenance Division
2022 Materials and Supplies

Denotes lowest bid which should be used because it was submitted by a qualified Aurora company that meets the Local Preference Ordinance 020-029.
The qualified bidder's original price was less than 5% more than the lowest submitted price and bidder has agreed to match the lowest submitted price. (Mid American Water, Inc. only qualified local vendor)

Core and Main LP Ferguson Waterworks Mid American Water, Inc. Unde:irlt‘)/:ngol’ipe & Water Products Company Zieb:::):f:ér ISnecrvice
Water & Sewer 2022 Materials and Supplies 220S. Westgate Dr 1720 State Street 1500 E. Mountain St. 211 Amem;lodée or. 3255 E. New York St. 2001 Pratty Blv&. Notes
Carol Stream, IL 60188 Dekalb, IL 60115 Aurora, IL 60505 Shorewood, IL 60404 Aurora, IL 60504 Elk Grove Village, IL
NO. |ITEM UNIT UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST
143 (16" Full Body MJ Ductile Iron Solid Sleeve EA $1,213.00 - - $1,732.00 $1,945.00 $2,200.00
144 (2" Cast Couplings EA $55.00 $35.13 $34.00 $31.50 $118.00 $50.00
145 (4" Cast Couplings EA $113.00 $82.98 $59.00 $74.00 $245.00 $85.00
146 (6" Cast Couplings EA $134.50 $101.52 $80.00 $90.50 $397.00 $117.00
147 (8" Cast Couplings EA $168.50 $140.08 $106.00 $124.75 $498.00 $149.00
148 (10" Cast Couplings EA $221.50 $196.22 $196.22* $174.75 $750.00 $199.00 Use local bid
149 (12" Cast Couplings EA $269.50 $273.77 $228.00 $243.75 $859.00 $240.00
150 [14" Cast Couplings EA $441.50 $409.78 $350.00 $365.00 - $385.00
151 [16" Cast Couplings EA $587.00 $409.54 $419.00 $397.00 - $575.00
152 |2" Single Bolt Standard Cast Couplings EA $106.50 - - - - $145.00
153 |4" Single Bolt Standard Cast Couplings EA $180.00 $292.43 - $271.00 - $248.00
154 |6" Single Bolt Standard Cast Couplings EA $238.00 $379.36 - $352.00 - $330.00
155 |8" Single Bolt Standard Cast Couplings EA $268.50 $430.74 - $399.00 - $370.00
156 |10" Single Bolt Standard Cast Couplings EA $265.50 $557.19 - $517.00 - $477.00
157 |12" Single Bolt Standard Cast Couplings EA $488.00 $655.98 - $608.00 - $563.00
158 |14" Single Bolt Standard Cast Couplings EA $1,083.50 - - - - $1,500.00
159 |16" Single Bolt Standard Cast Couplings EA $1,116.50 - - - - $1,540.00
160 |2" Single Bolt XL Cast Couplings EA - - - - - - No Bid
161 |4" Single Bolt XL Cast Couplings EA - $304.68 - $283.00 - -
162 |6" Single Bolt XL Cast Couplings EA - $394.78 - $366.00 - -
163 |8" Single Bolt XL Cast Couplings EA $448.52 - $416.00 - -
164 |10" Single Bolt XL Cast Couplings EA - $579.72 - $537.00 - -
165 |12" Single Bolt XL Cast Couplings EA - $682.47 - $633.00 - -
166 |14" Single Bolt XL Cast Couplings EA - - - - - - No Bid
167 |16" Single Bolt XL Cast Couplings EA - $3,759.66 - $3,483.00 - -
168 |2" Single Bolt Transition Cast Couplings EA - - - - - - No Bid
169 |4" Single Bolt Transition Cast Couplings EA - $298.78 - $277.00 - -
170 |6" Single Bolt Transition Cast Couplings EA - $387.47 - $359.00 - -
171 |8" Single Bolt Transition Cast Couplings EA - $439.63 - $408.00 - -
172 |10" Single Bolt Transition Cast Couplings EA - $560.32 - $527.00 - -
173 |12" Single Bolt Transition Cast Couplings EA - $668.83 - $620.00 - -
174 |14" Single Bolt Transition Cast Couplings EA - - - - - - No Bid
175 |16" Single Bolt Transition Cast Couplings EA - - - - - - No Bid
176 |4" Megalug Restraint for Ductile Iron Pipe EA $26.00 - $26.00 $47.50 $49.00 $50.00 Use local bid
177 |4" Megalug Restraint for PVC Pipe EA $31.50 - $31.00 $53.25 $55.00 $60.00
178 |6" Megalug Restraint for Ductile Iron Pipe EA $30.50 - $30.00 $60.50 $64.00 $55.00
179 |6" Megalug Restraint for PVC Pipe EA $38.50 - $37.00 $68.25 $72.00 $69.00
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Bid Tabulation
City of Aurora Water & Sewer
Maintenance Division
2022 Materials and Supplies

Denotes lowest bid which should be used because it was submitted by a qualified Aurora company that meets the Local Preference Ordinance 020-029.
The qualified bidder's original price was less than 5% more than the lowest submitted price and bidder has agreed to match the lowest submitted price. (Mid American Water, Inc. only qualified local vendor)
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— —
180 |8" Megalug Restraint for Ductile Iron Pipe EA $46.00 - $46.00 $76.50 $81.00 $75.00 Use local bid
181 |8" Megalug Restraint for PVC Pipe EA $56.50 - $56.00 $86.50 $91.00 $89.00
182 |10" Megalug Restraint for Ductile Iron Pipe EA $68.50 - $67.00 $109.25 $112.00 $97.00
183 10" Megalug Restraint for PVC Pipe EA $107.00 - $106.00 $146.50 $149.00 $115.00
184 |12" Megalug Restraint for Ductile Iron Pipe EA $99.00 - $98.00 $140.00 $144.00 $119.00
185 [12" Megalug Restraint for PVC Pipe EA $112.00 - $109.00 $152.50 $156.00 $135.00
186 |2" Tyler Mechanical Joint Accessory Kit EA - - - $17.75 - $45.00 Investigate cost difference
187 |4" Tyler Mechanical Joint Accessory Kit EA $41.00 - - $23.75 $39.00 $50.00 Investigate cost difference
188 |6" Tyler Mechanical Joint Accessory Kit EA $53.50 - - $28.00 $50.50 $55.00 Investigate cost difference
189 |8" Tyler Mechanical Joint Accessory Kit EA $68.50 - - $33.00 $55.00 $60.00 Investigate cost difference
190 |10" Tyler Mechanical Joint Accessory Kit EA $97.00 - - $45.00 $75.00 $80.00 Investigate cost difference
191 |12" Tyler Mechanical Joint Accessory Kit EA $125.50 - - $48.25 $79.00 $90.00 Investigate cost difference
192 |4" Ductile Iron Tyler Bored Out Flange EA $53.00 - - - - $150.00 Investigate cost difference
193 |6" Ductile Iron Tyler Bored Out Flange EA $58.00 - - - - $200.00 Investigate cost difference
194 |8" Ductile Iron Tyler Bored Out Flange EA $78.00 - - - - $250.00 Investigate cost difference
195 |10" Ductile Iron Tyler Bored Out Flange EA $100.00 - - - - $300.00 Investigate cost difference
196 |12" Ductile Iron Tyler Bored Out Flange EA $134.00 - - - - $350.00 Investigate cost difference
Water Main Pipe Items
197 (4" CL 52 Ductile Iron Pipe, 18' EA $643.50 - $590.76 $594.00 $656.10 $690.00
198 [6" CL 52 Ductile Iron Pipe, 18' EA $494.80 - $454.30 $474.30 $504.90 $590.00
199 (8" CL 52 Ductile Iron Pipe, 18' EA $698.00 - $638.10* $638.10 $711.90 $870.00 Use local bid
200 |10" CL 52 Ductile Iron Pipe, 18' EA $915.00 - $835.20* $835.20 $933.30 $950.00 Use local bid
201 |12" CL 52 Ductile Iron Pipe, 18' EA $1,152.40 - $1,052.10* $1,052.10 $1,175.00 $1,220.00 Use local bid
202 |16" CL 52 Ductile Iron Pipe, 18' EA $1,667.40 - $1,522.80* $1,522.80 $1,701.00 $1,450.00 Use local bid
Water Service Related Items
203 |3/4" Flared Corporation Stop EA $31.00 $28.25 - $26.95 - $35.00
204 |1" Flared Corporation Stop EA $47.00 $43.18 - $41.20 - $59.00
205 |1 1/2" Flared Corporation Stop EA $136.00 $132.45 - $126.40 - $153.00
206 |2" Flared Corporation Stop EA $254.50 $231.38 - $220.75 - $258.00
207 |3/4" Full Port Flared Curb Box EA $68.50 $69.22 - $66.05 - $77.00
208 |1" Full Port Flared Curb Box EA $111.00 $93.40 - $89.15 - $105.00
209 |1 1/2" Full Port Flared Curb Box EA $229.00 $219.49 - $209.40 - $245.00
210 |2" Full Port Flared Curb Box EA $370.00 $355.11 - $338.80 - $390.00
211 |1 1/4" Curb Box EA $43.50 $30.32 - $28.50 $53.00 $59.00
212 |11/2" Curb Box EA $59.00 $53.41 - $50.15 $73.00 $85.00
213 |1 1/4" Curb Box Top EA $9.00 $12.42 - $11.70 $18.00 $15.00
214 |Curb Box Extension Replacement Slip Sleeve EA $19.00 - - - $16.00 $25.00
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2022 Materials and Supplies

Denotes lowest bid which should be used because it was submitted by a qualified Aurora company that meets the Local Preference Ordinance 020-029.
The qualified bidder's original price was less than 5% more than the lowest submitted price and bidder has agreed to match the lowest submitted price. (Mid American Water, Inc. only qualified local vendor)
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215 |3/4" Type K Copper - 60' Roll EA $492.75 - - - $473.40 $420.00
216 |3/4" Type K Copper - 100' Roll EA $821.25 - - - $789.00 $700.00
217 [1" Type K Copper - 60' Roll EA $651.72 - - - $628.20 $540.00
218 [1" Type K Copper - 100' Roll EA $1,086.25 - - - $1,047.00 $900.00
219 |1 1/2" Type K Copper - 60' Roll EA $1,069.50 - - - $979.20 $900.00
220 |1 1/2" Type K Copper - 100" Roll EA $1,782.50 - - - $1,632.00 $1,500.00
221 |2" Type K Copper - 40' Roll EA $1,108.50 - - - $1,038.80 $1,000.00
222 |2" Type K Copper - 60' Roll EA $1,662.75 - - - $1,558.20 $1,500.00
223 |3/4" Copper to 3/4" Copper Coupling EA $20.00 $16.99 - $16.25 - $37.00
224 |3/4" Copper to 1" Copper Coupling EA $29.50 $25.19 - $24.05 - $49.00
225 |1" Copper to 1" Copper Coupling EA $35.00 $29.76 - $28.40 - $49.00
226 |3/4" Copper to 3/4" Strong Lead-Pack Coupling EA $33.00 $28.36 - $27.10 - $36.00
227 |3/4" Copper to 3/4" Extra Strong Lead-Pack Coupling EA $39.00 $33.50 - $32.00 - $41.00
228 |3/4" Copper to 3/4" Double Extra Strong Lead-Pack Coupling EA $46.00 $39.49 - $37.70 - $48.00
229 |1" Copper to 3/4" Strong Lead-Pack Coupling EA $57.50 $49.66 - $47.41 - $53.00
230 |1" Copper to 3/4" Extra Strong Lead-Pack Coupling EA $55.50 $47.86 - $45.70 - $62.00
231 |1" Copper to 1" Strong Lead-Pack Coupling EA $68.50 $59.07 - $56.40 - $67.00
232 |1" Copper to 1" Extra Strong Lead-Pack Coupling EA $49.00 $42.13 $39.00 $40.20 - $53.00
233 |1" Copper to 1" Double Extra Strong Lead-Pack Coupling EA $61.50 $53.28 $51.00 $50.85 - $90.00
Meter Items
234 |3/4" Ford Meter Horn EA $78.00 $70.32 $77.00 $67.10 - $91.00
235 |1" Ford Meter Horn EA $121.50 $109.39 $121.00 $104.40 - $145.00
236 |3/4" Ford Ball Valve (Check Specifications) EA $65.00 - $47.00 - - $55.99
237 |1" Ford Ball Valve (Check Specifications) EA $97.00 - $74.00 - - $86.99
238 |5/8" x 1/2" Pipe Thread Ford Meter Coupling (50/pkg) Pkg $294.50 $436.50 $850.00 $417.50 - $465.00
239 |5/8" x 3/4" Pipe Thread Ford Meter Coupling (50/pkg) Pkg $283.50 $495.50 $1,000.00 $475.00 - $525.00 Confirm Quantity per
240 |3/4" Ford Meter Coupling (25/pkg) Pkg $283.50 $276.25 $475.00 $263.75 - $280.00 Package
241 |1" Ford Meter Coupling (15/pkg) Pkg $436.50 $229.80 $405.00 $219.75 - $229.95
242 |1 1/2" Large Bronze Meter Flange Kit EA $75.00 $95.81 - $91.45 - $150.00
243 |2" Large Bronze Meter Flange Kit EA $80.00 $131.54 - $125.50 - $210.00
244 |3" Large Bronze Meter Flange Kit EA $215.00 $244.88 - $233.65 - $450.00
245 |4" Large Bronze Meter Flange Kit EA $330.00 $391.22 - $373.25 - $600.00
246 |3" Zenner FHZ30S Hydrant Meter w/Check Valve EA - - - - $950.00 -
247 |Ground clamp, 1 1/2" EA $4.00 - - - - -




Bid Tabulation
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2022 Materials and Supplies
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Storm Sewer Items
248 |Manhole Frame & Solid Lid, 4", R-1647-B EA - $306.67 - - $375.00 $340.00
249 |Manhole Frame & Solid Lid, 7", R-1772-B EA - $306.67 - - $375.00 $340.00
250 |Manhole Frame & Solid Lid, 9", R-1713-B EA - $312.22 - - $410.00 $350.00
251 [Combination Inlet Frame, Grate, & Curb Box, R-3015-R EA - $434.44 - - $569.00 $480.00
252 |Beehive Grate, R-4340-B EA - $182.22 - - $224.00 $205.00
253 |Beehive Grate, R-4341-A EA - $282.22 - - - $315.00
254 |Beehive Grate, R-4342 EA - $277.78 - - - $310.00
255 |Solid Cover R-1712 EA - $140.00 - - $172.00 $157.00
256 |Open Cover R-2502, Type D EA - $128.89 - - $158.00 $145.00
257 |Curb Box - R-3015 EA - $125.56 - - - $145.00
258 |Curb Frame R-3015 EA - $193.33 - - - $218.00
259 |Grate - R-3015 EA - $155.56 - - - $130.00
260 [Inlet Filter for IDOT Type 1 Frame (Manhole Frame) EA $115.00 - - $119.00 $135.00 $125.00
261 [Inlet Filter for IDOT Type 8 Frame (Behive Frame) EA $121.00 - - $119.00 $140.00 $130.00
262 |Inlet Filter for IDOT Type 23 Frame (Combination Curb Frame) EA $151.00 - - $122.00 $145.00 $130.00
263 |Composite Adjusting Ring, 3/4" x 1-1/2" EA $56.00 - - $55.00 - -
264 |Composite Adjusting Ring, 0.75" EA $41.00 - - $40.00 - -
265 |Composite Adjusting Ring, 1" EA $45.50 - - $44.00 - -
266 |Composite Adjusting Ring, 1.25" EA $52.50 - - $50.00 - -
267 |Composite Adjusting Ring, 1.5" EA $59.50 - - $56.00 - - Underground Pipe Price
268 |Composite Adjusting Ring, 1.75" EA $64.00 - - $60.00 . . good thru 10/27/22
269 |Composite Adjusting Ring, 2" EA $73.50 - - $68.00 - -
270 |Composite Adjusting Ring, 2.25" EA $80.50 - - $74.00 - -
271 |Composite Adjusting Ring, 2.5" EA $86.50 - - $79.00 - -
272 |Composite Adjusting Ring, 4" EA $126.00 - - $117.00 - -
273 |Composite Adjusting Ring, 6" EA $173.50 - - $160.00 - -
274 |M-1 Structural Adhesive/Sealant EA $16.50 - - $18.00 - -
275 [2' x 24" Catch Basin with Base EA - - - - $129.00 -
276 |2' x 30" Catch Basin with Base EA - - - - - - No Bid
277 |2'x 36" Catch Basin with Base EA - - - - - - No Bid
278 |2' x 48" Catch Basin with Base EA - - - - - - No Bid
279 |3'x 36" Catch Basin with Base EA - - - - - - No Bid
280 |3'x 16" Barrell Section EA - - - - - - No Bid
281 |3'x 24" Barrell Section EA - - - - - - No Bid
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282 |3'x 36" Barrell Section EA - - - - - - No Bid
283 |3'x 48" Barrel Section EA - - - - - - No Bid
284 |3'x 18" Cone Offset EA - - - - - - No Bid
285 [3' Flat Top Eccentric Opening, Non-Tongue and groove EA - - - - - - No Bid
286 |3' Flat Top Concentric Opening, Non-Tongue and groove EA - - - - - - No Bid
287 |3' Flat Top Eccentric Opening, Tongue and Groove EA - - - - - - No Bid
288 [3' Flat Top Concentric Opening, Tongue and groove EA - - - - - - No Bid
289 |3' Diameter Base EA - - - - - - No Bid
290 (4' Flat Top, 6" Thickness, Concentric Opening, Tongue and Groove EA - - - - - - No Bid
291 |4' Flat Top, 6" Thickness Eccentric Opening Tongue and Groove EA - - - - - - No Bid
292 |4' Flat Top, 6" Thickness, Concentric Opening, Non-Tongue and Groove EA - - - - - - No Bid
293 |4' Flat Top, 6" Thickness Eccentric Opening Non-Tongue and Groove EA - - - - - - No Bid
294 |4' Flat Top, 12" Thickness, Concentric Tongue and Groove EA - - - - - - No Bid
295 (4' Flat Top, 12" Thickness, Eccentric Tongue and Groove EA - - - - - - No Bid
296 |4' Flat Top, 12" Thickness, Concentric Non-Tongue and groove EA - - - - - - No Bid
297 |4' Flat Top, 12" Thickness, Eccentric Non-Tongue and groove EA - - - - - - No Bid
298 |4' x 32" Manhole with Base EA - - - - - - No Bid
299 |4' x 48" Barrel Section EA - - - - - - No Bid
300 |4' Base EA - - - - - - No Bid
301 |5' Flat Top, 6" Thickness, Concentric Opening, Tongue and Groove EA - - - - - - No Bid
302 |5' Flat Top, 6" Thickness Eccentric Opening Tongue and Groove EA - - - - - - No Bid
303 [5' Flat Top, 6" Thickness, Concentric Opening, Non-Tongue and Groove EA - - - - - - No Bid
304 [5' Flat Top, 6" Thickness Eccentric Opening Non-Tongue and Groove EA - - - - - - No Bid
305 [5' Flat Top, 12" Thickness, Concentric Tongue and Groove EA - - - - - - No Bid
306 |5' Flat Top, 12" Thickness, Eccentric Tongue and Groove EA - - - - - - No Bid
307 |5' Flat Top, 12" Thickness, Concentric Non-Tongue and groove EA - - - - - - No Bid
308 |5' Flat Top, 12" Thickness, Eccentric Non-Tongue and groove EA - - - - - - No Bid
309 |5'x 32" Manhole with Base EA - - - - - - No Bid
310 |5' x 48" Barrel Section EA - - - - - - No Bid
311 |5'Base EA - - - - - - No Bid
312 |12" Diameter ADS N-12 (Water Tight Joints, 20" Sticks) EA $183.00 - - $155.00 $194.40 $300.00

313 |15" Diameter ADS N-12 (Water Tight Joints, 20" Sticks) EA $253.25 - - $216.00 $270.00 $400.00

314 |12" Diameter RCP EA - - - - - - No Bid
315 |15" Diameter RCP EA - - - - - - No Bid
316 (18" Diameter RCP EA - - - - - - No Bid




Denotes lowest bid

Bid Tabulation
City of Aurora Water & Sewer
Maintenance Division
2022 Materials and Supplies

Denotes lowest bid which should be used because it was submitted by a qualified Aurora company that meets the Local Preference Ordinance 020-029.
The qualified bidder's original price was less than 5% more than the lowest submitted price and bidder has agreed to match the lowest submitted price. (Mid American Water, Inc. only qualified local vendor)

Core and Main LP Ferguson Waterworks Mid American Water, Inc. Unde:,garlt‘)/:ngoPlpe & Water Products Company Zleb:::]:ﬁ:r ISnecrvnce
Water & Sewer 2022 Materials and Supplies 220S. Westgate Dr 1720 State Street 1500 E. Mountain St. 211 A é d. o 3255 E. New York St. 2001 P tt' Bl d Notes
Carol Stream, IL 60188 Dekalb, IL 60115 Aurora, IL 60505 mendodge Dr. Aurora, IL 60504 ra t Ivd.
Shorewood, IL 60404 Elk Grove Village, IL

NO. |ITEM UNIT UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST
317 |24" Diameter RCP EA - - - - - - No Bid
318 |12" Diameter RCP Flared End Section EA - - - - - - No Bid
319 [15" Diameter RCP Flared End Section w/Grate EA - - - - - - No Bid
320 [18" Diameter RCP Flared End Section w/Grate EA - - - - - - No Bid
321 |24" Diameter RCP Flared End Section w/Grate EA - - - - - - No Bid
Sanitary Sewer Items
322 Sanitary Manhole Chimney Seals EA $161.50 - $240.00 $165.00 $184.00 $280.00
323 |4" SDR-26 PVC 22.5 Degree Bend EA $25.00 - $32.00 $33.84 $46.00
324 |4" SDR-26 PVC 45 Degree Bend EA $19.00 - $24.00 $25.49 $35.00

N Underground Pipe noted
325 |6" SDR-26 PVC 22.5 Degree Bend EA $46.50 - $60.00 $58.00 $85.00 price subject to change so
326 |6" SDR-26 PVC 45 Degree Bend EA $34.50 - $44.00 $46.80 $64.00 may need to switch to

2nd lowest bidder
327 |6"x6" SDR-26 PVC WYE EA $68.50 - $88.00 $85.17 $142.00
328 |6"x6" SDR-26 PVC Tee EA $60.00 - $77.00 $82.57 $125.00
329 |8" SDR-26 PVC 22.5 Degree Bend EA $82.50 - $110.00 $106.57 $159.00
330 |8" SDR-26 PVC 45 Degree Bend EA $84.50 - $109.00 $105.72 $158.00
331 |8"x6" SDR-26 PVC WYE EA $89.00 - $114.00 $121.70 $185.00
332 [8"x6" SDR-26 PVC Tee EA $84.50 - $109.00 $115.78 $175.00 Underground Pipe noted
price subject to change so
333 |10" SDR-26 PVC 22.5 Degree Bend EA $183.00 - $237.00 $228.48 $340.00 N
may need to switch to

334 10" SDR-26 PVC 45 Degree Bend EA $167.00 - $216.00 $229.18 $310.00 2nd lowest bidder
335 |10"x6" SDR-26 PVC WYE EA $198.50 - $257.00 $272.64 $413.00
336 |10"x6" SDR-26 PVC Tee EA $193.00 - $250.00 $240.87 $402.00
337 |4" SDR-26 PVC Pipe, 14' EA $50.75 - $50.40 $62.30 $57.40 $63.00
338 |6" SDR-26 PVC Pipe, 14' EA $113.40 - $116.20 $140.00 $128.10 $121.00
339 |8" SDR-26 PVC Pipe, 14' EA $205.10 - $211.12 $253.40 $231.98 $220.00
340 |10" SDR-26 PVC Pipe, 14' EA $319.37 - $328.72 $398.30 $361.20 $325.00
341 |12" SDR-26 PVC Pipe, 14' EA $459.02 - $472.50 $566.30 $519.26 $470.00
342 |15" SDR-26 PVC Pipe, 14' EA $689.67 - $709.80 $849.10 $779.94 $710.00
343 118" SDR-26 PVC Pipe, 14' EA - - $1,105.16 $1,361.50 - $980.00
Miscellaneous Items
344 |Krylon Industrial Quik-Mark Blue Marking Paint, 17 Oz EA $2.88 - - - $3.75 -
345 |Krylon Industrial Quik-Mark Green Marking Paint, 17 Oz EA $2.88 - - - $3.75 -
346 |Krylon Industrial Quik-Mark White Marking Paint, 17 Oz EA $2.88 - - - $3.75 -
347 |Hydraulic Cement, 50 LB Pail EA $30.00 - - - $39.00 -
348 [Masonary Mortar Type M, 80Ib Bag EA $10.00 - - - - -
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349 |Concrete Precast Brick - 2.25" x3.5" x 7.5" Pallet - - - - - - No Bid
350 |Concrete Precast Block - 3.5" x 7.5" x 15.5" Pallet - - - - - - No Bid
351 [Mastic Sealing Band, 3"x50' Roll - - - - - - No Bid
352 [Mastic Sealing Band, 6"x50' Roll - - - - - - No Bid
353 [Mastic Sealing Band, 9"x50' Roll - - - - - - No Bid
354 [Mastic Sealing Band, 12"x50' Roll - - - - - - No Bid
355 |Butyl Rubber Sealant, 3/8"x3.5"x16' Roll - - - - $32.00 -
356 |Butyl Rubber Sealant, 3/4"x3/4"x16' Roll - - - - - - No Bid
357 [Type Il Barricade EA - - - - - - No Bid
The City of Aurora reserves the right to reject any or all bids, to waive technicality, Note: Mid American Water Bid was missing page 8

informality or irregularity in the bids received. The City further reserves the right to
award the bid to the lowest responsible bidder whose offer best responds in quality,
fitness and capacity to the requirements of the proposed work or usage and therefore
is in the best interest of the City.
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