
KANE COUNTY 

SPECIAL COUNTY BOARD 

TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 26, 2019 

 County Board Room  Agenda  4:00 PM 

  Kane County Government Center, 719 S. Batavia Ave., Bldg. A, Geneva, IL 60134 
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1. CALL TO ORDER 

2. ROLL CALL 

3. PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE 

4. EXECUTIVE SESSION 

5. OPEN SESSION - Consideration and Action 

A. #19-416: Settlement of Claims No. 19WC5603 & 19WC18203 (Not included) 

B. #19-417: Settlement of Claim No. 18WC35636 (Not included) 

C. Settlement of Claim No. 19WC03609 (Not included) 

D. Settlement of Claim No. FMCS 190610-07969 (Not included) 

E. Settlement of Claim No. 19CH789 (Not included) 

6. Discussion and Vote to Rescind and Replace Resolution 19-393 

#19 - 418 Rescind the Award of Resolution 19-393 to an Incorrect Vendor 
and Correct the Award to Authorize the Purchase of Gasoline and 
Diesel Fuel for Division of Transportation, Sheriff's Office, Building 
Management, and Other Intergovernmental Agencies - (Bid 45-019) 

7. ADJOURNMENT TO TUESDAY, December 10, 2019 



 

 

 

RESOLUTION/ORDINANCE EXECUTIVE SUMMARY 
   

Resolution No. 19 - 418   

Rescind the Award of Resolution 19-393 to an Incorrect Vendor and 
Correct the Award to Authorize the Purchase of Gasoline and Diesel Fuel 
for Division of Transportation, Sheriff's Office, Building Management, and 
Other Intergovernmental Agencies - (Bid 45-019) 

  
Committee Flow: County Board    
Contact: Gabriella Figliozzi, 630.444.1230  

 
Budget Information: 

Was this item budgeted? N/A Appropriation Amount:  

If not budgeted, explain funding source: 

 
Summary: 

This resolution corrects the award that was approved with resolution 13-393, for fuel.   
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STATE OF ILLINOIS 

 

COUNTY OF KANE 

 

RESOLUTION NO.  19 - 418 
 

RESCIND THE AWARD OF RESOLUTION 19-393 TO AN INCORRECT VENDOR AND 
CORRECT THE AWARD TO AUTHORIZE THE PURCHASE OF GASOLINE AND DIESEL 

FUEL FOR DIVISION OF TRANSPORTATION, SHERIFF'S OFFICE, BUILDING 
MANAGEMENT, AND OTHER INTERGOVERNMENTAL AGENCIES - (BID 45-019) 

 

WHEREAS, bids have been solicited and received by the Kane County Purchasing 
Department for the purchase and bulk delivery of gasoline and diesel fuel to the Kane County 
Division of Transportation,  Sheriff’s Office, Building Management for power generator, and 
Intergovernmental Agencies ; and 

 

WHEREAS, through Resolution 19-393 Mansfield Oil Company of 1025 Airport Parkway 
SW., Gainesville, GA 30501 was incorrectly awarded a contract as the lowest, responsive, 
responsible bidder for all fuel products due to a transcription error on the extended bid tab; and 

 

WHEREAS, the Notice of Award was sent to all six (6) participating Vendors of Bid 45-019, 
with Purchasing Staff being notified that an error occurred in the mark-up cost  for Petroleum 
Traders Corporation as reported in the final bid tabulation for Resolution 19-393; and 

 

WHEREAS, it was determined after the award of Resolution 19-393 that Petroleum Traders 
Corporation of 7120 Pointe Inverness Way, P.O. Box 2357, Fort Wayne, IN is the correct lowest, 
responsive, responsible bidder for all fuel products per bid specifications based on the “low side” as 
published in the "OPIS Price Index” to commence from December 1, 2019 to November 30, 2020;  
plus the following additional charges; and  

 

WHEREAS, Blu Petroleum, 21402 W. Hwy 60 Mundelein, IL 60060 was determined to be 
the lowest responsive, responsible bidder for the  tank wagon delivery of fuel products per bid 
specifications based on the “low side” as published in the "OPIS Price Index” to commence from 
December 1, 2019 to November 30, 2020, plus the following additional charges:  

 

Regular Gasoline (no lead) $0.0269 per gallon

Bio Diesel Fuel #2 (B5) $0.0453 per gallon

Bio Diesel Fuel #2 (B5) Pre-Blend Winter Mixture 50 #1clear / 50 #2 $0.0564 per gallon 

Bio Diesel Fuel #2 (B5) Pre-Blend Winter Mixture 80/20 $0.0564 per gallon

Generator Diesel Fuel #2 (B5) $0.7590 per gallon

Generator Diesel Fuel #2 (B5) – Winter Blend $0.7590 per gallon

Regular Gasoline (no lead) $0.1300 per gallon

Bio Diesel Fuel #2 (B5) $0.1500 per gallon

Petroleum Traders Corporation

(Tank Wagon delivery – Forest Preserve, City of Aurora, and Intergovernmental Agencies)

 
 
WHEREAS, the gasoline and diesel fuel shall be delivered by said low bidder to the Kane 

County Division of Transportation (KDOT) and deposited in the underground storage tanks located 
at the KDOT facility; and 
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WHEREAS, the gasoline fuel shall be delivered by said low bidder to the Kane County 
Sheriff’s Office and deposited in the underground storage tanks located at the Sheriff’s Office 
facility; and 

 

WHEREAS, the gasoline and diesel fuel shall be delivered by said low bidder to the various 
Kane County Power Generators at multiple locations and other Intergovernmental Agencies and 
deposited in both the underground and aboveground tanks as specified within bid document; and 

 

WHEREAS, the funding for Gasoline and Diesel Fuel has already been appropriated as part 
of the 2020 budget; and 

 

WHEREAS, it is in the best interest of the County to rescind Resolution 19-393 for the 
contract award to Mansfield Oil of Gainesville, GA and  Blu Petroleum of Mundelein, IL and award 
the contract to Petroleum Traders of Fort Wayne, IN and Blu Petroleum of Mundelein, IL, the two 
most responsive, responsible low bidders for the purchase and delivery of no-lead gasoline and 
diesel fuel; and   

 

WHEREAS, by the Kane County Board that rescinding Resolution 19-393 for the award of 
Bid 45-019 to Mansfield Oil of Gainesville, GA and Blu Petroleum of Mundelein, IL for the correct 
award of contract to Petroleum Traders Corporation of Fort Wayne, IN and Blu Petroleum, LLC of 
Mundelein, IL for the sale and bulk delivery of fuel products (No-Lead Gasoline, Bio Diesel #2 (B5), 
Bio Diesel #2 - Pre Blend Winter Mix 80/20, and Winterized Diesel 50/50) as specified per Kane 
County Bid 45-019 Gasoline and Diesel Fuel delivered to both the underground and aboveground 
tanks located at the Kane County Division of Transportation, Sheriff’s Office, various County’s 
electric power generators, and other Intergovernmental Agencies be accepted.  The contract price 
for No-Lead Gasoline and all Bio Diesel Fuels shall be based on the low side of “OPIS Price Index” 
plus above listed “markup” per gallon.  

 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Kane County Board that Resolution 19-393 
is hereby rescinded and that the Chairman is authorized to enter into a one (1) year contract with 
two (2) renewal options for bulk delivery of No-Lead Gasoline and Bio Diesel Fuel with Petroleum 
Traders of Fort Wayne, IN and Blu Petroleum, LLC of Mundelein, IL for (small quantity wagon 
delivery) commencing December 1, 2019 to November 30, 2020.   

 
Line Item Line Item Description Was 

personnel/item/service 

approved in original 

budget or a subsequent 

budget revision? 

Are funds currently 

available for this 

personnel/item/service in 

the specific line item? 

If funds are not 

currently available in 

the specified line 

item, where are the 

funds available? 

300.520.520.63040 Fuel - Vehicles Yes Yes  

001.380.380.63040 Fuel - Vehicles Yes Yes  
 

 Passed by the Kane County Board on November 26, 2019. 
 
 
 

________________________________    _____________________________ 
John A. Cunningham      Christopher J. Lauzen 
Clerk, County Board      Chairman, County Board 
Kane County, Illinois      Kane County, Illinois 
 

Vote:  
 

19-11 Rescind19-393 
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AGENDA ITEM EXECUTIVE SUMMARY Agenda Item #

Name

Presenter/Sponsor:

Appropriation Amount:

If not budgeted, 
explain funding 
source

Budget Information:       Was this item budgeted?

SUMMARY:

 Attachments:

Staff Name:
 Detailed information available from :

Phone:

 Resolution/Ordinance Tracking:

Assigned Committee:   on:

 County Board Date:

 If Other, specify:

  Resolution

  Ordinance

 No  N/A Yes

Sent to:

 Next Committee: Sent to:   on:

 Next Committee: Sent to:   on:

 Committee Remarks:

 Committee Remarks:

 Committee Remarks:

 If Other, specify:
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County of Kane 
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 

KANE COUNTY GOVERNMENT CENTER 
 
 
719 S. Batavia Avenue, Bldg. A. Telephone: (630) 232-5929 
Geneva, Illinois 60134 Fax: (630) 208-5107 
  
 
 

 
November 20, 2019 

PROCUREMENT SYNOPSIS 
 

Requesting Department: 
Purchasing Department for KDOT, Sheriff, Building, Building 
Management and IT. 

Procurement Name: 45-019 Gasoline & Diesel Fuels 

Recommended Vendor: Petroleum Traders Corp., and Blu Petroleum, Inc. 

Amount of Award:  (Projected Cost of $400,000.00) 

 
NOTIFICATION AND RESPONSE         
 
Public Notices:  ● County of Kane’s Web site ● Tribune Publishing (Aurora Beacon News)  

Advertising Date:   September 27, 2019 Notices sent/Plan Holders:   27/14 

Bid Due Date:  October 16, 2019  Bids Received: 6 

 
This contract is for the purchase and delivery of no-lead gasoline and diesel fuel for the Kane County 
Division of Transportation, Sheriff, Building Management, and other Intergovernmental agencies 
within Kane County.  This is a one (1) year contract with two (2) mutual option for renewal periods.  
 
The Purchasing Department with the support of Division of Transportation and Sheriff evaluated all 
bids per specifications and contract requirements and determined that Petroleum Traders Corporation 
of Fort Wayne, IN was the most responsive, responsible bidder for Kane County and recommending 
Blu Petroleum, Inc of Mundelein, IL for small quantity delivery.   
 
Bid Tabulation:   
 
Vendors Estimated Total Cost 

Petroleum Traders - Fort Wayne, IN $365,612.61 

Mansfield Oil Co., - Gainesville, GA $367,701.03 

Blu Petroleum, Inc - Mundelein, IL $367,964.76 

Al Warren Oil Co., Inc - Hammond, IN $369,377.26 

Heritage Petroleum - Evansville, IN $369,582.26 

*  Feece Oil Co. -  Minooka, IL (No Bid) * 
*Not bidding on all fuel items as specified.  See Exhibit – A: Final Tabulation for “mark-up’ and total cost per estimated quantity for all 
fuel products per specifications for Kane County Div. of Transportation and Sheriff.   

 
Based on overall cost of all fuel items, qualifications, bid compliance, and with the support of the 
evaluation team, staff recommends awarding the contract for bulk purchase and delivery of the 
County’s regular no-lead gasoline and all bio diesel fuel to Petroleum Traders Corporation of Fort 
Wayne, IN and Blu Petroleum, Inc of Mundelein, IL for small quantity delivery, pending committee and 
full Kane County Board’s approval. 
 
 
Submitted By: 
Tim Keovongsak, CPPB, Buyer III 
Purchasing Department 
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Exhibit A - Bid Tabulation
 45-019 Gasoline and Diesel Fuel

Gasoline Cost per Gallon Est. Qty. Total Est. Cost

Mansfield Oil - Gainesville, GA 1.7708$            105,000 185,934.00$    

Petroleum Traders - Fort Wayne, IN 1.7464$            105,000 183,372.00$    

Heritage Petroleum - Evansville, IN 1.7795$            105,000 186,847.50$    

Blu Petroleum, Inc - Mundelein, IL 1.7685$            105,000 185,692.50$    

Al Warren Oil Co., Inc - Hammond, IN 1.7695$            105,000 185,797.50$    

Feece Oil Co. - Minooka, IL No Bid 105,000 -$             

Bio Diesel B5 #2 Cost per Gallon Est. Qty. Total Est. Cost

Mansfield Oil - Gainesville, GA 1.9303$            30,000 57,909.00$      

Petroleum Traders - Fort Wayne, IN 1.9117$            30,000 57,351.00$      

Heritage Petroleum - Evansville, IN 1.9264$            30,000 57,792.00$      

Blu Petroleum, Inc - Mundelein, IL 1.9354$            30,000 58,062.00$      

Al Warren Oil Co., Inc - Hammond, IN 1.9164$            30,000 57,492.00$      

Feece Oil Co. - Minooka, IL No Bid 30,000 -$             

Winter Blend 50% #1 Clear & 50% #2 Cost per Gallon Est. Qty. Total Est. Cost

Mansfield Oil - Gainesville, GA 2.3581$            50,000 117,905.00$    

Petroleum Traders - Fort Wayne, IN 2.3849$            50,000 119,245.00$    

Heritage Petroleum - Evansville, IN 2.3885$            50,000 119,425.00$    

Blu Petroleum, Inc - Mundelein, IL 2.3975$            50,000 119,875.00$    

Al Warren Oil Co., Inc - Hammond, IN 2.3985$            50,000 119,925.00$    

Feece Oil Co. - Minooka, IL No Bid 50,000 -$             

Generator - B5 #2 Cost per Gallon Est. Qty. Total Est. Cost

Mansfield Oil - Gainesville, GA 2.4898$            1,075 2,676.54$        

Petroleum Traders - Fort Wayne, IN 2.6254$            1,075 2,822.31$        

Heritage Petroleum - Evansville, IN 2.5664$            1,075 2,758.88$        

Blu Petroleum, Inc - Mundelein, IL 2.0164$            1,075 2,167.63$        

Al Warren Oil Co., Inc - Hammond, IN 2.8664$            1,075 3,081.38$        

Feece Oil Co. - Minooka, IL No Bid 1,075 -$             

Generator - Winter Blend 50/50 Cost per Gallon Est. Qty. Total Est. Cost

Mansfield Oil - Gainesville, GA 3.0479$            1,075 3,276.49$        

Petroleum Traders - Fort Wayne, IN 2.6254$            1,075 2,822.31$        

Heritage Petroleum - Evansville, IN 2.5664$            1,075 2,758.88$        

Blu Petroleum, Inc - Mundelein, IL 2.0164$            1,075 2,167.63$        

Al Warren Oil Co., Inc - Hammond, IN 2.8664$            1,075 3,081.38$        

Feece Oil Co. - Minooka, IL No Bid 1,075 -$             

Estimated Grand Total 

Cost

365,612.61$              

367,701.03$                  

367,964.76$                  

369,377.26$                  

369,582.26$                  

-$                              Feece Oil Co. - Minooka, IL 

Kane County Division of Transportation & Sheriff

Mansfield Oil - Gainesville, GA

Blu Petroleum, Inc - Mundelein, IL

Al Warren Oil Co., Inc - Hammond, IN

Heritage Petroleum - Evansville, IN

Petroleum Traders - Fort Wayne, IN
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WEDNESDAY, OCTOBER 16, 2019 @ 3 PM

Final Tabulation - Revised

OPIS $1.7195 OPIS $1.8664 OPIS $2.3285 OPIS $2.0512 OPIS $1.8664 OPIS $2.3310 

OPIS + Markup OPIS + Markup OPIS + Markup OPIS + Markup OPIS + Markup OPIS + Markup

TOTAL PRICE/GAL TOTAL PRICE/GAL TOTAL PRICE/GAL TOTAL PRICE/GAL TOTAL PRICE/GAL TOTAL PRICE/GAL

Mansfield Oil - Gainsville, GA $0.0513 $1.7708 $0.0639 $1.9303 $0.0296 $2.3581 $0.0343 $2.0855 $0.6234 $2.4898 $0.7169 $3.0479

Petroleum Traders - Fort Wayne, IN $0.0269 $1.7464 $0.0453 $1.9117 $0.0564 $2.3849 $0.0564 $2.1076 $0.7590 $2.6254 $0.7590 $3.0900

Heritage Petroleum - Evansville, IN $0.0600 $1.7795 $0.0600 $1.9264 $0.0600 $2.3885 $0.0600 $2.1112 $0.7000 $2.5664 $0.8000 $3.1310

Blu Petroleum, Inc - Mundelein, IL $0.0490 $1.7685 $0.0690 $1.9354 $0.0690 $2.3975 $0.0690 $2.1202 $0.1500 $2.0164 $0.1500 $2.4810

Al Warren Oil Co., Inc - Hammond, IN $0.0500 $1.7695 $0.0500 $1.9164 $0.0700 $2.3985 $0.0600 $2.1112 $1.0000 $2.8664 $1.0000 $3.3310

Feece Oil Co. -  Minooka, IL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

OPIS $1.7195 OPIS $1.8664 OPIS $1.8714 OPIS $1.7195 

OPIS + Markup OPIS + Markup OPIS + Markup OPIS + Markup

TOTAL PRICE/GAL TOTAL PRICE/GAL TOTAL PRICE/GAL TOTAL PRICE/GAL

Mansfield Oil - Gainsville, GA $0.3527 $2.0722 $0.5695 $2.4359 $1.4792 $3.3506 $0.5344 $2.2539

Petroleum Traders - Fort Wayne, IN $0.2580 $1.9775 $0.2580 $2.1244 $0.5590 $2.4304 $0.3590 $2.0785

Heritage Petroleum - Evansville, IN $0.3000 $2.0195 $0.3000 $2.1664 $0.7500 $2.6214 $0.7500 $2.4695

Blu Petroleum, Inc - Mundelein, IL $0.1300 $1.8495 $0.1500 $2.0164 $0.1500 $2.0214 $0.1300 $1.8495

Feece Oil Co. -  Minooka, IL $0.1350 $1.8545 $0.1350 $2.0014 $0.1350 $2.0064 $0.1350 $1.8545

Al Warren Oil Co., Inc - Hammond, IN $0.2000 $1.9195 $0.2000 $2.0664 $1.0000 $2.8714 $1.0000 $2.7195

INTERGOVERNMENTAL UNITS

OPIS $1.7195 OPIS $1.7195 OPIS $1.8664 OPIS $1.8664 OPIS $2.3285 OPIS $2.3285 

OPIS + Markup OPIS + Markup OPIS + Markup OPIS + Markup OPIS + Markup OPIS + Markup

TOTAL PRICE/GAL TOTAL PRICE/GAL TOTAL PRICE/GAL TOTAL PRICE/GAL TOTAL PRICE/GAL TOTAL PRICE/GAL

Mansfield Oil - Gainsville, GA $0.6394 $2.3589 $0.0866 $1.8061 $0.6295 $2.4959 $0.0801 $1.9465 $0.9221 $3.2506 $0.0461 $2.37460

Petroleum Traders - Fort Wayne, IN $0.3590 $2.0785 $0.0296 $1.7491 $0.2580 $2.1244 $0.0453 $1.9117 $0.7590 $3.0875 $0.0564 $2.3849

Blu Petroleum, Inc - Mundelein, IL $0.1300 $1.8495 $0.0490 $1.7685 $0.1500 $2.0164 $0.0690 $1.9354 $0.1500 $2.4785 $0.0690 $2.3975

Al Warren Oil Co., Inc - Hammond, IN $0.7500 $2.4695 $0.0500 $1.7695 $0.7500 $2.6164 $0.0500 $1.9164 $0.7500 $3.0785 $0.0700 $2.3985

Heritage Petroleum - Evansville, IN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Feece Oil Co. -  Minooka, IL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

** Same OPIS report dated 10/11/2019  **

GENERATORS: Bio Diesel 

45-019 GASOLINE & DIESEL FUEL

(#1) - GASOLINE (#3) - Bio Diesel #2 - B5 (#5) - 50% -50% Winter (#6) - Winter Blend Diesel - (#1) - Non-Road Diesel Fuel (#2) Non-Road Diesel Fuel - 

REGULAR GASOLINE - Bio Diesel Fuel #2 (B5) Multi- Diesel - Winter Blend 50% Bio Diesel Fuel #2 - GENERATORS: Bio Diesel 

MARKUP

WAGGON DELIVERY - Aboveground Tank (FP) WAGGON DELIVERY - Generators & Airport (City of Auroa)

(#2) GASOLINE (#4) - Bio Diesel #2 - (B5) (#3) Bio Diesel #2 - B5 (#4) GASOLINE

VENDOR
MARKUP MARKUP MARKUP MARKUP MARKUP

MARKUP

REGULAR GASOLINE - Bio Diesel Fuel #2 (B5) - GENERATOR: Bio Diesel REGULAR GASOLINE - 

VENDOR
MARKUP MARKUP MARKUP

(A) GASOLINE (B) Bio Diesel Fuel #2 (B5) (C) 50% -50% Winter Blend

WAGGON DELIVERY (200 - TANK DELIVERY (7000 - WAGGON DELIVERY (200 - TANK DELIVERY (7000 - WAGON DELIVERY (200 - TANK DELIVERY (7000 - 

MARKUP
VENDOR

MARKUP MARKUP MARKUP MARKUP MARKUP
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