DIVISION 12-1I-5 FUEL GAS CODE
Sec 12-17.4 Same; Additions, Insertions Deletions And Changes

Sec 12-17.4 Same; Additions, Insertions, Deletions And Changes
The following sections of the 2024 International Fuel and Gas Code; adopted in section 12-
16 is hereby revised as follows:

101.1is amended to read:

Title. These regulations shall be known as the Fuel Gas Code of The City of Auroraf”{ Formatted:

Indent: Left: 0.5"

hereinafter referred to as "this code.”

103.1 is amended to read:

The Division of Building and Permits under the Developments Services Departmenbf‘[ Formatted:

Indent: Left: 0.5"

is hereby created and the official in charge thereof shall be known as the building
official. Any reference in this code to the code official shall mean the building

official. The function of the agency shall be the implementation, administration, and
enforcement of the provisions of this code.

Section106:6.2 Insert-108.2.1 is added to read:

See International Building Code Section 109 *”{ Formatted:

Indent: First line:

05"

Subseetion106-6:3-shall- be-changed-toread-asfellews:-108.6 is amended to read

106:6-3-The code official shall authorize the refunding of fees per the International«—/{ Formatted:

Indent: Left: 0.5"

Building Code Section 109.6.

113.4 is amended to read: The-follewing Subsection-shall be-added-to-seetion108-4:
10841

Violation Penalties shall be as prescribed in the International Building Code Section*”{ Formatted:

Indent: Left: 0.5"

114.4
The-following-Subseetion-shall be-added-to-seection108:5:-113.4.1 is added to read:

168:513-Unlawful continuance fines shall be as prescribed in the International*”{ Formatted:

Indent: Left: 0.5"

Building Code Section 115.3

112.1 is amended to read:

109-1-Appeals—Appeals to this code shall be conducted as prescribed in the adopted*”{ Formatted

: Indent: Left: 0.5"

International Building Code.


https://aurora-il.municipalcodeonline.com/book?type=ordinances#name=DIVISION_12-II-5_FUEL_GAS_CODE
https://aurora-il.municipalcodeonline.com/book?type=ordinances#name=Sec_12-17.4_Same;_Additions,_Insertions,_Deletions_And_Changes
https://aurora-il.municipalcodeonline.com/book?type=ordinances#name=Sec_12-17.4_Same;_Additions,_Insertions,_Deletions_And_Changes

112.2 is deleted.
112.3 is deleted.
112.4 is deleted

113.4 is amended to read:

Violation Penalties shall be as prescribed in the International Building Code Section«”{ Formatted: Indent: Left: 0.5"

114.4.

301.1.2 Natural Gas Services is added to read:

New R-2 apartment buildings or existing buildings converting to R-2 use shall be
served with an independently metered service per dwelling unit.

306.5.3. is added to read:

A hose bib shall be provided within 200 feet of any serviceable equipment located on*”{ Formatted: Indent: Left: 0.5"

a roof more than 16 feet above grade plane and greater than 5000 square feet in area.
Hose bibs shall be installed in accordance with the Illinois Plumbing Code.

Subseetion403:4:3-403.3.3 Copper and Copper Alloy. Shall be deleted
Subseetion403:44403.3.4-Aluminum. Shall be deleted
Subseetion-403.45 Metallic tubing. Shall be deleted

Thefollowing-Subseetion—shall- be-added-te-seetion503-6:11:-503.6.12.1 B Vent support is
added to read:

503:611-1-B Vent support: B vent support shall be provided horizontally every 5 feet«”{ Formatted: Indent: Left: 0.5"

minimum with no screw penetrations unless specifically required by the vent
manufacturer and then only when it can be demonstrated that the inner wall of the
vent has not been penetrated.

Formatted: Justified, Indent: Left: 0.5", Space After:
7.5 pt, Line spacing: single, Pattern: Clear (White)




