Bid Tabulation
15-50
Chemicals for the City of Aurora Water Treatment Plant
Bid Opening October 21, 2015

1 2 3
Fluorosilicic Powdered
Company Name . Activated Cationic
Acid
Carbon Polymer
Alexander Chemical Corporation Year 1 0.271
Alexander Chemical Corporation Year 2 No Bid
BASF Corporation Year 1 0.236
BASF Corporation Year 2 0.246
Cabot Norit Americas Inc. Year 1 0.64
Cabot Norit Americas Inc. Year 2 0.66
Cabot Norit Americas Inc. Alternate Year 1 0.54
Cabot Norit Americas Inc. Alternate Year 2 0.56
Calgon Carbon Corporation Year 1 0.527
Calgon Carbon Corporation Year 2 0.542
Kemira Year 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kemira Year 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mosaic Global Sales,LLC Year 1 0.236
Mosaic Global Sales,LLC Year 2 0.236
Nalco Company Year 1 0.55
Nalco Company Year 2 0.60
Pencco,Inc. Year 1 0.246
Pencco,Inc. Year 2 0.248
Polydyne Inc. Year 1 0.230
Polydyne Inc. Year 2 0.230
Solvay Flourides Year 1 No Bid
Solvay Flourides Year 2 No Bid
Standard Purificaton Year 1 0.544
Standard Purificaton Year 2 0.554
Thatcher Company of Montana,Inc Year 1 0.545
Thatcher Company of Montana,Inc Year 2 0.545
Umicore Marketing Services USA Inc. Year 1 1.20
Umicore Marketing Services USA Inc. Year 2 1.20
Univar USA Year 1 0.3625 0.352
Univar USA Year 2 0.3625 0.352

LOW BID




