Veterinary Medical Services Bristol Veterinary Clinic [Oswego Animal Hospital

Line Item |Description |Quanti1 Unit of Meas Unit Cost Unit Cost
In-House Care

In-House Veterinary Visits (per

1 hour) 1 Hour $250.00 $80.00
In-Clinic Care
Emergency Exam Fee (regular
2 business hours) 1 Each $160.00 $147.00
3 General Exam Fee 1 Each $75.00 $58.00
4 Canine Boarding (Standard) 1 Day No Bid $34.00
5 Canine Boarding (Medical) 1 Day No Bid $49.00
6 Feline Boarding (Standard) 1 Day No Bid $25.00
7 Feline Boarding (Medical) 1 Day No Bid $49.00
8 Canine Euthanasia 1 Each $160.00 $103.00
9 Feline Euthanasia 1 Each $90.00 $80.00
10 Other Species Euthanasia 1 Each No Bid $80.00
11 Radiographs (Per View) 1 Each $240.00 $82.00
12 Ultrasound 1 Each No Bid $499.00
13 Wound Clip/Clean 1 Each $35.00 $27.00
Grooming Services
14 Ear Cleaning 1 Each $26.00 $25.00
15 Bath 1 Each No Bid $26.00
16 Nail Trim 1 Each $29.00 $27.00
17 Full Groom 1 Each No Bid $75.00
18 Dematting 1 Each No Bid $75.00
Vaccines/Treatments
19 1 Year Rabies Vaccine 1 Each $40.00 $30.00
20 Canine Distemper 1 Each $27.00 $38.00

21 FVRCP 1 Each $25.00 $29.00



22 Bordetella 1 Each $30.00 $32.00
23 Canine Influenza 1 Each $36.00 $37.00
24 Convenia Injection 1 Each $75.00 $65.00
25 Microchip 1 Each $45.00 $44.00
26 Fluid Therapy 1 Each $30.00 $44.00
27 Nebulization 1 Each No Bid $29.00
Testing
28 Full Blood Panel 1 Each $360.00 $217.00
29 Triple Snap or FeLV/FIV test 1 Each $50.00 $90.00
30 Heartworm Test 1 Each $60.00 $48.00
31 Parvo Test 1 Each $65.00 $63.00
32 Fecal 1 Each $42.00 $40.00
33 Ringworm 1 Each No Bid $123.00
34 Skin Scrape 1 Each No Bid $40.00
35 Eye Stain 1 Each S47.00 $24.00
36 Histopathology (Per Site) 1 Each $230.00 $200.00
37 Histopathology (Complex) 1 Each $425.00 $374.00
38 Biopsy Punch 1 Each No Bid $82.00
Additional Fees (If Applicable)
39 Health Certifiate 1 Each No Bid $53.00
40 Sedation Injection 1 Each $100.00 $116.00
41 Medical Waste Fee 1 Each No Bid $5.00
42 Elizabethan Collar 1 Each $15.00 $13.00
43 Pain Injection (Canine) 1 Each $20.00 $20.00
44 Pain Injection (Feline) 1 Each $25.00 $20.00




