
 

City of Aurora, IL 

Purchasing 
Jolene Coulter, Director of Purchasing 

44 E Downer Place, Aurora, IL 60502 
 

 

 

EVALUATION TABULATION 
ITB No. 26-004 

Electrical Lighting Materials 
RESPONSE DEADLINE: February 11, 2026 at 11:00 am 

Report Generated:  Thursday, March 12, 2026 
 
COBRA HEAD FIXTURES   
Primary award cells are green and Backup award cells are gray 

 Dominion Lighting EverLights, Inc. Graybar Electric 

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of 
Measure 

Unit Cost Product Code Lead 
Time 

Unit Cost Product Code Lead 
Time 

Unit Cost Product Code Lead Time 

1 GE Cobra 
Head - Gray 

23 EA No Bid ERL1008C740EGRAYI 
(57W)  $219.15 ERL1008C740EGRAYI 

(57W)  $210.00 ERL1008C740EGRAYI 
(57W) 

6 Weeks 

2 GE Cobra 
Head - Gray 

23 EA No Bid ERL1005C740EGRAYI 
(39w)  $209.57 ERL1005C740EGRAYI 

(39w)  $430.00 ERL1005C740EGRAYI 
(39w) 

6 Weeks 

3 GE Cobra 
Head - Black 

23 EA No Bid ERL2018C740DBLCKAIR 
(125W)  $446.81 ERL2018C740DBLCKAIR 

(125W)  $430.00 ERL2018C740DBLCKAIR 
(125W) 

6 Weeks 

4 GE Cobra 
Head - Gray 

23 EA No Bid ERL2018C740DGRAYAIR 
(125W)  $446.81 ERL2018C740DGRAYAIR 

(125W)  $200.00 ERL2018C740DGRAYAIR 
(125W) 

6 Weeks 

5 GE Cobra 
Head - Black 

23 EA No Bid ERL2H18C730DBLCKAIR 
(146W, 480V)  $455.32 ERL2H18C730DBLCKAIR 

(146W, 480V)  $438.00 ERL2H18C730DBLCKAIR 
(146W, 480V) 

6 Weeks 

6 GE Cobra 
Head - Gray 

23 EA No Bid ERL2H18C730DGRAYAIR 
(146W, 480V)  $455.32 ERL2H18C730DGRAYAIR 

(146W, 480V)  $438.00 ERL2H18C730DGRAYAIR 
(146W, 480V) 

6 Weeks 

 

DRIVERS   
Primary award cells are green and Backup award cells are gray 
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 Dominion Lighting EverLights, Inc. Graybar Electric 

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of 
Measure 

Unit Cost Product Code Lead 
Time 

Unit Cost Product Code Lead 
Time 

Unit Cost Product Code Lead 
Time 

7 39W 
Replacement 

Drivers 

200 EA No Bid 35-225097R30 290MA  $69.15 35-225097R30 290MA  $66.50 35-225097R30 290MA  

8 100W 
Replacement 

Drivers 

200 EA No Bid GED100MC/VDIP700S  $76.60 GED100MC/VDIP700S  $74.00 GED100MC/VDIP700S  

9 150W 
Replacement 

Drivers 

200 EA No Bid GED150/MC/VDIP1050S  $61.70 GED150/MC/VDIP1050S  $59.50 GED150/MC/VDIP1050S  

10 180W 
Replacement 

Drivers 

50 EA No Bid 35-225096R28 490MA  $69.15 35-225096R28 490MA  $66.50 35-225096R28 490MA  

 

POLES, BOLLARDS, BASES AND OTHER FIXTURES   
Primary award cells are green and Backup award cells are gray 

 Dominion Lighting EverLights, Inc. Graybar Electric 

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of 
Measure 

Unit Cost Product Code Lead Time Unit Cost Product Code Lead Time Unit Cost Product Code Lead Time 

11 Sentry 12' 
Decorative 
Aluminum 

Pole 

3 EA $3,200.00 SAL-CC-12'-BK 
W/2" DAIM X 

3" TALL 
TENON, LESS 

ANCHOR 
BOLTS NOTE - 
4" DIA, 10" BC, 
BLACK FINISH 

 $2,705.32 SAL-CC-12'-BK 
W/2" DAIM X 

3" TALL 
TENON, LESS 

ANCHOR 
BOLTS NOTE - 
4" DIA, 10" BC, 
BLACK FINISH 

NO BOLTS No Bid SAL-CC-12'-BK 
W/2" DAIM X 

3" TALL 
TENON, LESS 

ANCHOR 
BOLTS NOTE - 
4" DIA, 10" BC, 
BLACK FINISH 

 

11 
ALTERNATE 

Hadco 12' 
Decorative 
Aluminum 

Pole 

3 EA No Bid CP16636  $4,095.75 CP16636 INCLUDES 
BOLTS 

$3,928.57 CP16636  
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 Dominion Lighting EverLights, Inc. Graybar Electric 

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of 
Measure 

Unit Cost Product Code Lead Time Unit Cost Product Code Lead Time Unit Cost Product Code Lead Time 

12 Sentry 16' 
Decorative 
Aluminum 

Pole 

2 EA $3,445.00 SAL-CC-16'-BK 
W/2" DAIM X 

3" TALL 
TENON, LESS 

ANCHOR 
BOLTS NOTE - 
4" DIA, 10" BC, 
BLACK FINISH 

 $3,018.09 SAL-CC-16'-BK 
W/2" DAIM X 

3" TALL 
TENON, LESS 

ANCHOR 
BOLTS NOTE - 
4" DIA, 10" BC, 
BLACK FINISH 

NO BOLTS No Bid SAL-CC-16'-BK 
W/2" DAIM X 

3" TALL 
TENON, LESS 

ANCHOR 
BOLTS NOTE - 
4" DIA, 10" BC, 
BLACK FINISH 

 

12 
ALTERNATE 

Hadco 16' 
Decorative 
Aluminum 

Pole 

2 EA No Bid CP16636B  $4,600.01 CP16636B INCLUDES 
BOLTS 

$4,412.24 CP16636B  

13 Valmont 20' 
Steel Pole 

4 EA $3,900.00 DS50-
700A240-4' 
LMA-FP/GV-
HH-NC-LAB 
(no finial) 

(EXISTING 14" 
BC/1" ABS) 

 $3,512.77 DS50-
700A240-4' 
LMA-FP/GV-
HH-NC-LAB 
(no finial) 

(EXISTING 14" 
BC/1" ABS) 

 No Bid DS50-
700A240-4' 
LMA-FP/GV-
HH-NC-LAB 
(no finial) 

(EXISTING 14" 
BC/1" ABS) 

 

13 
ALTERNATE 

Ameron 20' 
Steel Pole 

4 EA No Bid P1700-S-8-
JRFE2229-2  $2,635.11 P1700-S-8-

JRFE2229-2  $2,527.55 P1700-S-8-
JRFE2229-2  

14 Valmont 12' 
Aluminum 

Pole 

25 EA $3,200.00 120040404UB 
Brookhaven  $2,706.38 120040404UB 

Brookhaven  No Bid 120040404UB 
Brookhaven  

14 
ALTERNATE 

Post 25 EA No Bid APSMDS-18-
12.00-E5-

TN2.38-4.00-
CU 

 No Bid APSMDS-18-
12.00-E5-

TN2.38-4.00-
CU 

 $3,814.29 APSMDS-18-
12.00-E5-

TN2.38-4.00-
CU 

 

15 Valmont 30' 
Aluminum 

Pole 

25 EA $3,600.00 270860808t4F 
(Satin)  $3,119.15 270860808t4F 

(Satin)  No Bid 270860808t4F 
(Satin)  
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 Dominion Lighting EverLights, Inc. Graybar Electric 

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of 
Measure 

Unit Cost Product Code Lead Time Unit Cost Product Code Lead Time Unit Cost Product Code Lead Time 

16 Valmont Pole 
(1 Arm) 

10 EA $5,577.00 DS210-
900A400-(1)-
8'LMA-FP/BK-
HH-NC-AB (no 

finial) 

 $5,131.91 DS210-
900A400-(1)-
8'LMA-FP/BK-
HH-NC-AB (no 

finial) 

 No Bid DS210-
900A400-(1)-
8'LMA-FP/BK-
HH-NC-AB (no 

finial) 

 

16 
ALTERNATE 

Ameron 40' 
Pole (1 Arm) 

10 EA No Bid P1700-S-8-
JRFE2229-1  $4,494.68 P1700-S-8-

JRFE2229-1  $4,311.22 P1700-S-8-
JRFE2229-1  

17 Valmont Pole 
(2 Arm) 

10 EA $8,517.00 DS210-
900A400-(2)-
8'LMA-FP/BK-
HH-NC-AB (no 

finial) 

 $8,003.19 DS210-
900A400-(2)-
8'LMA-FP/BK-
HH-NC-AB (no 

finial) 

 No Bid DS210-
900A400-(2)-
8'LMA-FP/BK-
HH-NC-AB (no 

finial) 

 

17 
ALTERNATE 

Ameron 40' 
Pole (2 Arm) 

10 EA No Bid P1700-D-8/8-
JRFE2229-1  $4,810.64 P1700-D-8/8-

JRFE2229-1  $4,614.29 P1700-D-8/8-
JRFE2229-1  

18 Stresscrete 
Pole 

30 EA No Bid E-250-APH-G 
(20')  $3,046.81 E-250-APH-G 

(20')  $2,937.00 E-250-APH-G 
(20')  

19 King Fixture 10 EA $2,327.00 K833-
75(SSL)8060 

120/277V 
(black) 

 $2,520.21 K833-
75(SSL)8060 

120/277V 
(black) 

 $2,429.00 K833-
75(SSL)8060 

120/277V 
(black) 

 

20 LV Fixture 25 EA $1,650.00 LPBA-40 LED 
4K-V-BK  $1,304.26 LPBA-40 LED 

4K-V-BK  No Bid LPBA-40 LED 
4K-V-BK  

20 
ALTENRATE 

Hadco 
Fixture 

25 EA No Bid C16248  $1,646.81 C16248  $1,579.59 C16248  

21 Sentry 
Fixture 

20 EA $3,100.00 SCP-NB-
LEDV29BP-07A 
803 DR KHT 3 

TLR7 BK 

 $2,653.19 SCP-NB-
LEDV29BP-07A 
803 DR KHT 3 

TLR7 BK 

 No Bid SCP-NB-
LEDV29BP-07A 
803 DR KHT 3 

TLR7 BK 
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 Dominion Lighting EverLights, Inc. Graybar Electric 

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of 
Measure 

Unit Cost Product Code Lead Time Unit Cost Product Code Lead Time Unit Cost Product Code Lead Time 

21 
ALTERNATE 

Spring City 
Fixture 

20 EA No Bid ALMPCL-
LE040-EVX-

2G2-30-CR3-
YKSF-TR7P-CU 

 $1,945.74 ALMPCL-
LE040-EVX-

2G2-30-CR3-
YKSF-TR7P-CU 

 $1,866.33 ALMPCL-
LE040-EVX-

2G2-30-CR3-
YKSF-TR7P-CU 

 

22 Sentry 
Bollard 

5 EA $4,929.00 SAL-B-BOL-
SLOT-INC 

(gloss black) 

 $4,584.04 SAL-B-BOL-
SLOT-INC 

(gloss black) 

 No Bid SAL-B-BOL-
SLOT-INC 

(gloss black) 

 

22 
ALTERNATE 

Spring City 
Bollard 

5 EA No Bid DBDMDS-18-
3.58-LT-

LE025/EVX/X1-
45--CN5-YCLF-

PP-CB 

 $3,502.13 DBDMDS-18-
3.58-LT-

LE025/EVX/X1-
45--CN5-YCLF-

PP-CB 

 $3,359.18 DBDMDS-18-
3.58-LT-

LE025/EVX/X1-
45--CN5-YCLF-

PP-CB 

 

23 Valmont 
Breakaway 

Transformer 
Base 

Aluminum 

12 EA $712.00 TB1-17  $648.94 TB1-17  $684.00 TB1-17  

24 Valmont 
Breakaway 

Transformer 
Base 

Aluminum 

12 EA $590.00 TB5-9  $517.02 TB5-9  $672.00 TB5-9  

25 Pelco 
Transformer 

Base 
Aluminum 

12 EA No Bid TB2N-1  No Bid TB2N-1  $785.00 TB2N-1  

 

VENDOR QUESTIONNAIRE PASS/FAIL 

Question Title Dominion Lighting EverLights, Inc. Graybar Electric 

Contact Information Pass Pass Pass 
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Question Title Dominion Lighting EverLights, Inc. Graybar Electric 

References Pass Pass Pass 

Sub-Contractor List Pass Pass Pass 

Eligibility Pass Pass Pass 

Bidder's Tax Certification Pass Pass Pass 

Bidder's Certification Pass Pass Pass 

Local Vendor Preference Application Pass Pass Pass 

Standard City of Aurora Contract Pass Pass  

Additional Information No Response No Response No Response 
 


