

Request For Proposal #26-022
Title: Healthy Houses HVAC Inspections and System Replacements

Inspection and Installation Rates				All Service Heating & Air Conditioning Inc	Amazing Air Inc.	Artlip and Sons, Inc.	Elemental Air Heating and Cooling LLC	Maxson Heating and Air Conditioning
Select	Line Item	Description	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost
	Labor							
X	1	Inspectors Rate	Hourly	\$140.00	\$189.00	No Bid	\$150.00	\$450.00
X	2	Labor & Auxiliary Charges	Hourly	\$140.00	\$280.00	\$180.00	\$200.00	\$135.00
X	3	Standard Labor Rate	Hourly	\$140.00	\$280.00	\$180.00	\$225.00	\$135.00
X	4	Emergency/After-Hours	Hourly	\$195.00	\$390.00	\$240.00	\$275.00	\$185.00
		Removal & Disposal (Recovery of old refrigerant						
X	6	and recycling)	Each	\$350.00	\$450.00	\$550.00	\$225.00	\$550.00
	Materials (not limited to)							
X	7	Full System Replacements	Each	\$12,500.00	\$18,000.00	\$15,000.00	\$8,500.00	\$7,800.00
X	8	Central AC + Gas Furnace	Each	\$10,500.00	\$15,000.00	\$15,000.00	\$5,000.00	\$7,800.00
X	9	Ducted Heat Pump System	Each	\$12,000.00	\$8,000.00	\$21,000.00	\$4,000.00	\$9,800.00
X	10	Ductless Mini-Split (per zone)	Each	\$4,250.00	\$2,000.00	\$5,000.00	\$800.00	\$6,000.00
X	11	Dual-Fuel (Hybrid) System	Each	\$13,500.00	\$21,000.00	\$20,000.00	\$6,000.00	\$9,800.00
X	12	Individual Component Replacement	Each	\$3,500.00	\$6,200.00	No Bid	\$450.00	\$300.00
X	13	Central AC Condenser Only	Each	\$5,200.00	\$5,900.00	\$6,000.00	\$2,500.00	\$5,500.00
X	14	Gas Furnace Only	Each	\$5,200.00	\$4,995.00	\$8,000.00	\$2,000.00	\$5,000.00
X	15	Evaporator Coil Replacement	Each	\$2,300.00	\$3,500.00	\$4,500.00	\$2,700.00	\$1,800.00
X	16	Indoor Air Quality (IAQ) & Filtration Add-ons	Each	\$650.00	\$1,500.00	\$1,500.00	\$500.00	\$1,200.00
X	17	High-Efficiency Media Filter	Each	\$650.00	\$1,500.00	\$4,500.00	\$300.00	\$1,200.00
X	18	Whole-Home UV Purifier	Each	\$850.00	\$1,500.00	\$2,000.00	\$600.00	\$1,200.00
X	19	Electronic Air Precipitator	Each	\$495.00	\$2,500.00	No Bid	\$1,000.00	No Bid
X	20	Whole-Home Humidifier	Each	\$950.00	\$925.00	\$2,750.00	\$600.00	\$750.00
X	21	Active Air Purifier	Each	\$850.00	\$4,800.00	\$2,000.00	\$600.00	\$1,200.00
X	22	New Ductwork (Run)	Each	\$300.00	\$750.00	\$15,000.00	\$1,000.00	\$550.00
		Total		\$74,660.00	\$99,659.00	\$123,400.00	\$37,625.00	\$61,355.00