Bid Tabulation
17-42

Chemicals for the City of Aurora Water Treatment Plant
Bid Opening October 18, 2017

1 2 3 4
. . Powdered :
Cationic Fluorosilicic N Sodium
Company Name Polymer Acid Activated Hypochlorite
Carbon

Alexander Chemical Corporation Year 1 0.178 0.694

Alexander Chemical Corporation Year 2 0.183 0.734

BASF Corporation Year 1 0.442

BASF Corporation Year 2 0.462

Cabot Norit Americas Inc. Year 1 0.535

Cabot Norit Americas Inc. Year 2 0.55

Calgon Carbon Corporation Year 1 0.54

Calgon Carbon Corporation Year 2 0.55

Carbon Activated Corporation Year 1 0.67

Carbon Activated Corporation Year 2 0.68

Carbpure Technologies, LLC Year 1 0.484

Carbpure Technologies, LLC Year 2 0.504

DPC Enterprises Year 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

DPC Enterprises Year 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Jacobi Carbons, Inc. Year 1 0.52

Jacobi Carbons, Inc. Year 2 0.539

Kemira Water Solutions, Inc. Year 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Kemira Water Solutions, Inc. Year 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Mosaic Global Sales,LLC Year 1 0.227

Mosaic Global Sales,LLC Year 2 0.227

Nalco Company, LLC Year 1 0.58

Nalco Company, LLC Year 2 0.63

Olin Chlor Alkali Products and Vinyls Year 1 0.63

Olin Chlor Alkali Products and Vinyls Year 2 0.63

Oxbow Activated Carbon LLC Year 1 0.556

Oxbow Activated Carbon LLC Year 2 0.556

Pencco,Inc. Year 1 0.1915

Pencco,Inc. Year 2 0.1915

Polydyne Inc. Year 1 0.32

Polydyne Inc. Year 2 0.32

Rowell Chemical Corporation Year 1 0.715

Rowell Chemical Corporation Year 2 No Bid

Standard Purificaton Year 1 0.59

Standard Purificaton Year 2 0.59

Univar USA Year 1 0.1850

Univar USA Year 2 No Bid

Vertex Chemical Corporation Year 1 0.91

Vertex Chemical Corporation Year 2 0.97




