
Bid Tabulation 

18-58

Chemicals for the City of Aurora Water Treatment Plant

Bid Opening October 24, 2018

1 2 3 4 5

Cationic
Polymer

Air Products and Chemicals, Inc. Year 1 0.0495

Air Products and Chemicals, Inc. Year 2 0.0495

Alexander Chemical Corporation Year 1 0.8758

Alexander Chemical Corporation Year 2 No Bid

Kemira Water Solutions, Inc.            Year 1 0.1020

Kemira Water Solutions, Inc. Year 2 0.1080

Maccarb Inc. Year 1 0.056

Maccarb Inc. Year 2 0.0575

Matheson Tri-Gas, Inc. Year 1 0.06

Matheson Tri-Gas, Inc. Year 2 0.067

Nalco Company LLC Year 1 0.85

Nalco Company LLC Year 2 0.92

Olin Chlor Alkali Products and Vinyls Year 1 0.67

Olin Chlor Alkali Products and Vinyls Year 2 0.72

PVS Technologies, Inc. Year 1 0.118

PVS Technologies, Inc. Year 2 0.122

Polydyne Inc. Year 1 0.56

Polydyne Inc. Year 2 0.61

Praxair, Inc.-As Read                                                Year 1 0.491

Praxair, Inc. Year 1 0.0491

Praxair, Inc.                   Year 2 0.0507

Rowell Chemical Corporation Year 1 0.788

Rowell Chemical Corporation Year 2 No Bid

Tanner Industries, Inc. Year 1 0.73

Tanner Industries, Inc. Year 2 0.745

Univar USA Inc. Year 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Univar USA Inc. Year 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Company Name Liquid Ferric 

Chloride Carbon Dioxide

Sodium 

Hypochlorite

Anhydrous 

Ammonia


