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Lot Location

J & G Services
Inc.
Aurora, IL

Montgomery
Landscaping,
Inc.
Bristol, IL

RB Enterprises
USA Aurora, IL

Semper Fi Yard
Service, Inc.
Aurora, IL

Aurora Transportation Center

RT 59 Transportation Center

Animal Control

Customer Svc / AFD Stn#8

COA Public Lot

Lots | &L

Lot W

LotY

Aurora Police Headquarters

Thrive

Lot X

Lot A

Lot C

Lot H

Lot S

X

X

X

XX XX

XXX XX

Selected Vendor
Back-up Vendor
No bid




Tovar Snow | Thom Gravel &
Professionals | Excavating, Inc.
East Dundee, IL Aurora, IL




CITY OF AURORA

Request for Proposal 20-32 Tabulation

Snow and Ice Control Services of Various Parking Lots

FINAL-#1 Aurora Transportation Center

Opened 2:00 pm, June 3, 2020

Montgomery Semper Fi Yard Tovar Snow
Landscaping, Inc. RB Enterprises Service, Inc. Professionals East

Bristol, IL USA Aurora, IL Aurora, IL Dundee, IL
Flat Rate Pricing
Up to 2" 2020/2021 1,290.00 1,785.00 No Bid 1,871.00
Up to 2" 2021/2022 1,290.00 1,785.00 No Bid 1,871.00
Up to 2" 2022/2023 1,340.00 1,895.00 No Bid 1,871.00
Up to 2" 2023/2024 1,340.00 1,895.00 No Bid 1,871.00
2.1"-4" 2020/2021 1,340.00 2,145.00 No Bid 3,743.00
2.1"-4" 2021/2022 1,340.00 2,145.00 No Bid 3,743.00
2.1"-4" 2022/2023 1,375.00 2,275.00 No Bid 3,743.00
2.1"-4" 2023/2024 1,375.00 2,275.00 No Bid 3,743.00
4.1"-6" 2020/2021 1,375.00 2,505.00 No Bid 5,614.00
4.1"-6" 2021/2022 1,375.00 2,505.00 No Bid 5,614.00
4.1"-6" 2022/2023 1,410.00 2,655.00 No Bid 5,614.00
4.1"-6" 2023-2024 1,410.00 2,655.00 No Bid 5,614.00
6.1"-8" 2020/2021 1,410.00 2,865.00 No Bid 7,486.00
6.1"-8" 2021/2022 1,410.00 2,865.00 No Bid 7,486.00
6.1"-8" 2022/2023 1,450.00 3,040.00 No Bid 7,486.00
6.1"-8" 2023-2024 1,450.00 3,040.00 No Bid 7,486.00
8.1" & Up 2020/2021 1,490.00 T™M No Bid 7,486.00
8.1" & Up 2021/2022 1,490.00 ™ No Bid 7,486.00
8.1" & Up 2022/2023 1,520.00 T™ No Bid 7,486.00
8.1" & Up 2023/2024 1,520.00 ™ No Bid 7,486.00
Salting Flat Rate Pricing
2020/2021 270.00 220.00 No Bid 1,759.00
2021/2022 270.00 220.00 No Bid 1,759.00
2022/2023 297.00 235.00 No Bid 1,759.00
2023/2024 297.00 235.00 No Bid 1,759.00
4X4 Vehicle w/ 8 Foot Plow
2020/2021 105.00 92.00 110.00 115.00
2021/2022 105.00 92.00 110.00 115.00
2022/2023 110.00 97.00 125.00 115.00
2023/2024 110.00 97.00 125.00 115.00
Single Axle Dump Truck
2020/2021 135.00 108.00 125.00 125.00
2021/2022 135.00 108.00 125.00 125.00
2022/2023 141.00 114.00 140.00 125.00
2023/2024 141.00 114.00 140.00 125.00
Rubber Tire Wheel Leader
2020/2021 190.00 195.00 235.00 275.00
2021/2022 190.00 195.00 235.00 275.00
2022/2023 200.00 205.00 250.00 275.00
2023/2024 200.00 205.00 250.00 275.00

The City of Aurora reserves the rig

ht to reject any or all bids, to waive technicality, informality or irregularity in the bids

received. The City further reserves the right to award the bid to the lowest responsible bidder whose offer best responds
in quality, fitness, and capacity to the requirements of the proposed work or usage and therefore is in the best interest of

the City.




CITY OF AURORA

Request for Proposal 20-32 Tabulation

Snow and Ice Control Services of Various Parking Lots

FINAL-#2 Route 59 Commuter Station

Opened 2:00 pm, June 3, 2020

Montgomery Semper Fi Yard Tovar Snow
Landscaping, Inc. RB Enterprises Service, Inc. Professionals East

Bristol, IL USA Aurora, IL Aurora, IL Dundee, IL
Flat Rate Pricing
Up to 2" 2020/2021 2,050.00 $3,810.00 No Bid 2,467.00
Up to 2" 2021/2022 2,050.00 $3,810.00 No Bid 2,467.00
Up to 2" 2022/2023 2,125.00 $4,040.00 No Bid 2,467.00
Up to 2" 2023/2024 2,125.00 4,040.00 No Bid 2,467.00
2.1"-4" 2020/2021 2,150.00 4,570.00 No Bid 4,934.00
2.1"-4" 2021/2022 2,150.00 4,570.00 No Bid 4,934.00
2.1"-4" 2022/2023 2,300.00 4,840.00 No Bid 4,934.00
2.1"-4" 2023/2024 2,300.00 4,840.00 No Bid 4,934.00
4.1"-6" 2020/2021 2,500.00 5,330.00 No Bid 7,400.00
4.1"-6" 2021/2022 2,500.00 5,330.00 No Bid 7,400.00
4.1"-6" 2022/2023 2,700.00 5,650.00 No Bid 7,400.00
4.1"-6" 2023-2024 2,700.00 5,650.00 No Bid 7,400.00
6.1"-8" 2020/2021 2,800.00 6,090.00 No Bid 9,867.00
6.1"-8" 2021/2022 2,800.00 6,090.00 No Bid 9,867.00
6.1"-8" 2022/2023 3,000.00 6,455.00 No Bid 9,867.00
6.1"-8" 2023-2024 3,000.00 6,455.00 No Bid 9,867.00
8.1" & Up 2020/2021 3,250.00 ™ No Bid 9,867.00
8.1" & Up 2021/2022 3,250.00 ™ No Bid 9,867.00
8.1" & Up 2022/2023 3,400.00 ™ No Bid 9,867.00
8.1" & Up 2023/2024 3,400.00 ™ No Bid 9,867.00
Salting Flat Rate Pricing
2020/2021 365.00 620.00 No Bid 3,156.00
2021/2022 365.00 620.00 No Bid 3,156.00
2022/2023 383.00 655.00 No Bid 3,156.00
2023/2024 383.00 655.00 No Bid 3,156.00
4X4 Vehicle w/ 8 Foot Plow
2020/2021 105.00 92.00 110.00 115.00
2021/2022 105.00 92.00 110.00 115.00
2022/2023 110.00 97.00 125.00 115.00
2023/2024 110.00 97.00 125.00 115.00
Single Axle Dump Truck
2020/2021 135.00 108.00 130.00 125.00
2021/2022 135.00 108.00 130.00 125.00
2022/2023 141.00 114.00 140.00 125.00
2023/2024 141.00 114.00 140.00 125.00
Rubber Tire Wheel Leader
2020/2021 190.00 195.00 235.00 275.00
2021/2022 190.00 195.00 235.00 275.00
2022/2023 200.00 205.00 250.00 275.00
2023/2024 200.00 205.00 250.00 275.00

The City of Aurora reserves the rig

ht to reject any or all bids, to waive technicality, informality or irregularity in the bids

received. The City further reserves the right to award the bid to the lowest responsible bidder whose offer best responds
in quality, fitness, and capacity to the requirements of the proposed work or usage and therefore is in the best interest of

the City.




CITY OF AURORA

Request for Proposal 20-32 Tabulation

Snow and Ice Control Services of Various Parking Lots

FINAL-#3 Aurora Animal Care & Control

Opened 2:00 pm, June 3, 2020

Montgomery Semper Fi Yard Tovar Snow
Landscaping, Inc. RB Enterprises Service, Inc. Professionals East

Bristol, IL USA Aurora, IL Aurora, IL Dundee, IL
Flat Rate Pricing
Up to 2.9" 2020/2021 175.00 120.00 No Bid 142.00
Up to 2.9" 2021/2022 175.00 120.00 No Bid 142.00
Up to 2.9" 2022/2023 190.00 125.00 No Bid 142.00
Up to 2.9" 2023/2024 190.00 125.00 142.00
3"-5.9" 2020/2021 190.00 135.00 No Bid 354.00
3"-5.9" 2021/2022 190.00 135.00 No Bid 354.00
3"-5.9" 2022/2023 210.00 140.00 No Bid 354.00
3"-5.9" 2023/2024 210.00 140.00 354.00
6"-7.9" 2020/2021 210.00 150.00 No Bid 496.00
6"-7.9" 2021/2022 210.00 150.00 No Bid 496.00
6"-7.9" 2022/2023 231.00 160.00 496.00
6"-7.9" 2023/2024 231.00 160.00 No Bid 496.00
8"-9.9" 2020/2021 235.00 165.00 No Bid 638.00
8"-9.9" 2021/2022 235.00 165.00 No Bid 638.00
8"-9.9" 2022/2023 258.00 175.00 No Bid 638.00
8"-9.9" 2023/2024 258.00 175.00 638.00
10" and Up 2020/2021 263.00 ™ No Bid 780.00
10" and Up 2021/2022 263.00 ™ No Bid 780.00
10" and Up 2022/2023 288.00 ™ No Bid 780.00
10" and Up 2023/2024 288.00 ™ 780.00
Salting Flat Rate Pricing
2020/2021 65.00 45.00 No Bid 184.00
2021/2022 65.00 45.00 No Bid 184.00
2022/2023 68.00 50.00 No Bid 184.00
2023/2024 68.00 50.00 No Bid 184.00
4X4 Vehicle w/ 8 Foot Plow
2020/2021 105.00 92.00 110.00 115.00
2021/2022 105.00 92.00 110.00 115.00
2022/2023 110.00 97.00 125.00 115.00
2023/2024 110.00 97.00 125.00 115.00

The City of Aurora reserves the rig

ht to reject any or all bids, to waive technicality, informality or irregularity in the bids

received. The City further reserves the right to award the bid to the lowest responsible bidder whose offer best responds
in quality, fitness, and capacity to the requirements of the proposed work or usage and therefore is in the best interest of

the City.




CITY OF AURORA

Request for Proposal 20-32 Tabulation

Snow and Ice Control Services of Various Parking Lots
FINAL-#4 Customer Service Center & Station 8
Opened 2:00 pm, June 3, 2020

Montgomery Semper Fi Yard Tovar Snow
Landscaping, Inc. RB Enterprises Service, Inc. Professionals East

Bristol, IL USA Aurora, IL Aurora, IL Dundee, IL
Flat Rate Pricing
Up to 2.9" 2020/2021 590.00 775.00 No Bid 164.00
Up to 2.9" 2021/2022 590.00 775.00 No Bid 164.00
Up to 2.9" 2022/2023 615.00 820.00 No Bid 164.00
Up to 2.9" 2023/2024 615.00 820.00 No Bid 164.00
3"-5.9" 2020/2021 615.00 865.00 No Bid 410.00
3"-5.9" 2021/2022 615.00 865.00 No Bid 410.00
3"-5.9" 2022/2023 635.00 915.00 No Bid 410.00
3"-5.9" 2023/2024 635.00 915.00 No Bid 410.00
6"-7.9" 2020/2021 635.00 955.00 No Bid 575.00
6"-7.9" 2021/2022 635.00 955.00 No Bid 575.00
6"-7.9" 2022/2023 660.00 1,015.00 No Bid 575.00
6"-7.9" 2023/2024 660.00 1,015.00 No Bid 575.00
8"-9.9" 2020/2021 660.00 1,045.00 No Bid 739.00
8"-9.9" 2021/2022 660.00 1,045.00 No Bid 739.00
8"-9.9" 2022/2023 690.00 1,110.00 No Bid 739.00
8"-9.9" 2023/2024 690.00 1,110.00 No Bid 739.00
10" and Up 2020/2021 715.00 T™M No Bid 903.00
10" and Up 2021/2022 715.00 ™ No Bid 903.00
10" and Up 2022/2023 740.00 T™ No Bid 903.00
10" and Up 2023/2024 740.00 ™ No Bid 903.00
Salting Flat Rate Pricing
2020/2021 240.00 560.00 No Bid 332.00
2021/2022 240.00 560.00 No Bid 332.00
2022/2023 257.00 595.00 No Bid 332.00
2023/2024 257.00 595.00 No Bid 332.00
4X4 Vehicle w/ 8 Foot Plow
2020/2021 105.00 92.00 110.00 115.00
2021/2022 105.00 92.00 110.00 115.00
2022/2023 110.00 97.00 125.00 115.00
2023/2024 110.00 97.00 125.00 115.00
Dump Truck w/ 10 Foot Plow
2020/2021 135.00 108.00 130.00 125.00
2021/2022 135.00 108.00 130.00 125.00
2022/2023 141.00 114.00 140.00 125.00
2023/2024 141.00 114.00 140.00 125.00
Sidewalk De-lcing Materials per
2020/2021 34.00 38.00 40.00 35.00
2021/2022 34.00 38.00 40.00 35.00
2022/2023 34.00 38.00 45.00 35.00
2023/2024 34.00 38.00 50.00 35.00

The City of Aurora reserves the rig

ht to reject any or all bids, to waive technicality, informality or irregularity in the bids

received. The City further reserves the right to award the bid to the lowest responsible bidder whose offer best responds
in quality, fitness, and capacity to the requirements of the proposed work or usage and therefore is in the best interest of

the City.




CITY OF AURORA

Request for Proposal 20-32 Tabulation

Snow and Ice Control Services of Various Parking Lots

FINAL-#5 City of Aurora Public Lot

Opened 2:00 pm, June 3, 2020

Montgomery Semper Fi Yard Tovar Snow
Landscaping, Inc. RB Enterprises Service, Inc. Professionals East

Bristol, IL USA Aurora, IL Aurora, IL Dundee, IL
Flat Rate Pricing
Up to 2.9" 2020/2021 190.00 100.00 No Bid 142.00
Up to 2.9" 2021/2022 190.00 100.00 No Bid 142.00
Up to 2.9" 2022/2023 200.00 105.00 No Bid 142.00
Up to 2.9" 2023/2024 200.00 105.00 No Bid 142.00
3"-5.9" 2020/2021 215.00 125.00 No Bid 354.00
3"-5.9" 2021/2022 215.00 125.00 No Bid 354.00
3"-5.9" 2022/2023 235.00 130.00 No Bid 354.00
3"-5.9" 2023/2024 235.00 130.00 No Bid 354.00
6"-7.9" 2020/2021 235.00 150.00 No Bid 496.00
6"-7.9" 2021/2022 235.00 150.00 No Bid 496.00
6"-7.9" 2022/2023 250.00 160.00 No Bid 496.00
6"-7.9" 2023/2024 250.00 160.00 No Bid 496.00
8"-9.9" 2020/2021 250.00 175.00 No Bid 638.00
8"-9.9" 2021/2022 250.00 175.00 No Bid 638.00
8"-9.9" 2022/2023 275.00 185.00 No Bid 638.00
8"-9.9" 2023/2024 275.00 185.00 No Bid 638.00
10" and Up 2020/2021 275.00 T™M No Bid 780.00
10" and Up 2021/2022 275.00 ™ No Bid 780.00
10" and Up 2022/2023 300.00 T™ No Bid 780.00
10" and Up 2023/2024 300.00 ™ No Bid 780.00
Salting Flat Rate Pricing
2020/2021 70.00 50.00 No Bid 152.00
2021/2022 70.00 50.00 No Bid 152.00
2022/2023 75.00 55.00 No Bid 152.00
2023/2024 75.00 55.00 No Bid 152.00
4X4 Vehicle w/ 8 Foot Plow
2020/2021 105.00 92.00 110.00 115.00
2021/2022 105.00 92.00 110.00 115.00
2022/2023 110.00 97.00 125.00 115.00
2023/2024 110.00 97.00 125.00 115.00
Sidewalk De-lcing Materials per
2020/2021 34.00 38.00 40.00 35.00
2021/2022 34.00 38.00 40.00 35.00
2022/2023 34.00 38.00 45.00 35.00
2023/2024 34.00 38.00 50.00 35.00
Parking Lot De-Icing Materials
2020/2021 130.00 145.00 210.00 200.00
2021/2022 130.00 145.00 220.00 200.00
2022/2023 130.00 145.00 230.00 200.00
2023/2024 130.00 145.00 240.00 200.00

The City of Aurora reserves the rig

ht to reject any or all bids, to waive technicality, informality or irregularity in the bids

received. The City further reserves the right to award the bid to the lowest responsible bidder whose offer best responds
in quality, fitness, and capacity to the requirements of the proposed work or usage and therefore is in the best interest of

the City.




CITY OF AURORA

Request for Proposal 20-32 Tabulation

Snow and Ice Control Services of Various Parking Lots

FINAL-#6 Parking Lots |

&L

Opened 2:00 pm, June 3, 2020

Semper Fi Yard Tovar Snow
J & G Services Inc. RB Enterprises Service, Inc. Professionals East
Aurora, IL USA Aurora, IL Aurora, IL Dundee, IL
Flat Rate Pricing
Up to 2.9" 2020/2021 200.00 2,140.00 400.00 510.00
Up to 2.9" 2021/2022 225.00 2,140.00 500.00 510.00
Up to 2.9" 2022/2023 225.00 2,260.00 550.00 510.00
Up to 2.9" 2023/2024 225.00 2,260.00 625.00 510.00
3"-5.9" 2020/2021 250.00 2,740.00 600.00 1,275.00
3"-5.9" 2021/2022 275.00 2,740.00 650.00 1,275.00
3"-5.9" 2022/2023 275.00 2,905.00 750.00 1,275.00
3"-5.9" 2023/2024 280.00 2,905.00 800.00 1,275.00
6"-7.9" 2020/2021 350.00 3,340.00 700.00 1,785.00
6"-7.9" 2021/2022 375.00 3,340.00 750.00 1,785.00
6"-7.9" 2022/2023 375.00 3,540.00 800.00 1,785.00
6"-7.9" 2023/2024 375.00 3,540.00 850.00 1,785.00
8"-9.9" 2020/2021 500.00 3,940.00 800.00 2,295.00
8"-9.9" 2021/2022 525.00 3,940.00 850.00 2,295.00
8"-9.9" 2022/2023 525.00 4,175.00 900.00 2,295.00
8"-9.9" 2023/2024 525.00 4,175.00 950.00 2,295.00
10" and Up 2020/2021 600.00 T™M ™ 2,805.00
10" and Up 2021/2022 625.00 ™ ™ 2,805.00
10" and Up 2022/2023 625.00 T™ ™ 2,805.00
10" and Up 2023/2024 625.00 ™ ™ 2,805.00
Salting Flat Rate Pricing
2020/2021 300.00 625.00 200.00 561.00
2021/2022 300.00 625.00 200.00 561.00
2022/2023 300.00 660.00 250.00 561.00
2023/2024 300.00 660.00 250.00 561.00
4X4 Vehicle w/ 8 Foot Plow
2020/2021 125.00 92.00 120.00 115.00
2021/2022 125.00 92.00 120.00 115.00
2022/2023 125.00 97.00 130.00 115.00
2023/2024 125.00 97.00 140.00 115.00
Sidewalk De-lcing Materials per
2020/2021 125.00 38.00 30.00 35.00
2021/2022 125.00 38.00 30.00 35.00
2022/2023 125.00 38.00 40.00 35.00
2023/2024 125.00 38.00 45.00 35.00

The City of Aurora reserves the rig

ht to reject any or all bids, to waive technicality, informality or irregularity in the bids

received. The City further reserves the right to award the bid to the lowest responsible bidder whose offer best responds
in quality, fitness, and capacity to the requirements of the proposed work or usage and therefore is in the best interest of

the City.




CITY OF AURORA

Request for Proposal 20-32 Tabulation

Snow and Ice Control Services of Various Parking Lots

FINAL-#7 Parking Lot

W

Opened 2:00 pm, June 3, 2020

Semper Fi Yard Tovar Snow
J & G Services Inc. RB Enterprises Service, Inc. Professionals East
Aurora, IL USA Aurora, IL Aurora, IL Dundee, IL
Flat Rate Pricing
Up to 2.9" 2020/2021 200.00 585.00 205.00 587.00
Up to 2.9" 2021/2022 225.00 585.00 275.00 587.00
Up to 2.9" 2022/2023 225.00 620.00 325.00 587.00
Up to 2.9" 2023/2024 225.00 620.00 375.00 587.00
3"-5.9" 2020/2021 250.00 760.00 300.00 1,468.00
3"-5.9" 2021/2022 275.00 760.00 350.00 1,468.00
3"-5.9" 2022/2023 275.00 805.00 400.00 1,468.00
3"-5.9" 2023/2024 275.00 805.00 450.00 1,468.00
6"-7.9" 2020/2021 350.00 935.00 400.00 2,055.00
6"-7.9" 2021/2022 350.00 935.00 450.00 2,055.00
6"-7.9" 2022/2023 350.00 995.00 475.00 2,055.00
6"-7.9" 2023/2024 359.00 995.00 500.00 2,055.00
8"-9.9" 2020/2021 500.00 1,110.00 500.00 2,642.00
8"-9.9" 2021/2022 500.00 1,110.00 550.00 2,642.00
8"-9.9" 2022/2023 500.00 1,175.00 600.00 2,642.00
8"-9.9" 2023/2024 500.00 1,175.00 600.00 2,642.00
10" and Up 2020/2021 600.00 ™ ™ 3,229.00
10" and Up 2021/2022 600.00 ™ ™ 3,229.00
10" and Up 2022/2023 600.00 ™ ™ 3,229.00
10" and Up 2023/2024 600.00 ™ ™ 3,229.00
Salting Flat Rate Pricing
2020/2021 300.00 125.00 200.00 478.00
2021/2022 300.00 125.00 200.00 478.00
2022/2023 300.00 130.00 250.00 478.00
2023/2024 300.00 130.00 275.00 478.00
4X4 Vehicle w/ 8 Foot Plow
2020/2021 125.00 92.00 120.00 115.00
2021/2022 125.00 92.00 120.00 115.00
2022/2023 125.00 97.00 130.00 115.00
2023/2024 125.00 97.00 140.00 115.00

The City of Aurora reserves the rig

ht to reject any or all bids, to waive technicality, informality or irregularity in the bids

received. The City further reserves the right to award the bid to the lowest responsible bidder whose offer best responds
in quality, fitness, and capacity to the requirements of the proposed work or usage and therefore is in the best interest of

the City.




CITY OF AURORA

Request for Proposal 20-32 Tabulation

Snow and Ice Control Services of Various Parking Lots

FINAL-#8 Parking Lot

Y

Opened 2:00 pm, June 3, 2020

Semper Fi Yard Tovar Snow
RB Enterprises Service, Inc. Professionals East
USA Aurora, IL Aurora, IL Dundee, IL
Flat Rate Pricing
Up to 2.9" 2020/2021 265.00 170.00 204.00
Up to 2.9" 2021/2022 265.00 250.00 204.00
Up to 2.9" 2022/2023 280.00 300.00 204.00
Up to 2.9" 2023/2024 280.00 330.00 204.00
3"-5.9" 2020/2021 340.00 230.00 509.00
3"-5.9" 2021/2022 340.00 250.00 509.00
3"-5.9" 2022/2023 360.00 300.00 509.00
3"-5.9" 2023/2024 360.00 330.00 509.00
6"-7.9" 2020/2021 415.00 270.00 712.00
6"-7.9" 2021/2022 415.00 300.00 712.00
6"-7.9" 2022/2023 440.00 330.00 712.00
6"-7.9" 2023/2024 440.00 370.00 712.00
8"-9.9" 2020/2021 490.00 310.00 916.00
8"-9.9" 2021/2022 490.00 350.00 916.00
8"-9.9" 2022/2023 520.00 380.00 916.00
8"-9.9" 2023/2024 520.00 420.00 916.00
10" and Up 2020/2021 ™ ™ 1,119.00
10" and Up 2021/2022 ™ ™ 1,119.00
10" and Up 2022/2023 ™ ™ 1,119.00
10" and Up 2023/2024 ™ ™ 1,119.00
Salting Flat Rate Pricing
2020/2021 55.00 110.00 166.00
2021/2022 55.00 110.00 166.00
2022/2023 60.00 120.00 166.00
2023/2024 60.00 130.00 166.00
4X4 Vehicle w/ 8 Foot Plow
2020/2021 92.00 120.00 115.00
2021/2022 92.00 120.00 115.00
2022/2023 97.00 130.00 115.00
2023/2024 97.00 140.00 115.00

The City of Aurora reserves the rig

ht to reject any or all bids, to waive technicality, informality or irregularity in the bids

received. The City further reserves the right to award the bid to the lowest responsible bidder whose offer best responds
in quality, fitness, and capacity to the requirements of the proposed work or usage and therefore is in the best interest of

the City.




CITY OF AURORA

Request for Proposal 20-32 Tabulation

Snow and Ice Control Services of Various Parking Lots
FINAL-#9 Police Department Parking Lot & Upper Deck
Opened 2:00 pm, June 3, 2020

Thom Gravel & Semper Fi Yard Tovar Snow
Excavating, Inc. RB Enterprises Service, Inc. Professionals East
Aurora, IL USA Aurora, IL Aurora, IL Dundee, IL

Flat Rate Pricing
Up to 2.9" 2020/2021 2,170.00 1,110.00 750.00 1,268.00
Up to 2.9" 2021/2022 2,215.00 1,110.00 800.00 1,267.00
Up to 2.9" 2022/2023 2,265.00 1,175.00 900.00 1,267.00
Up to 2.9" 2023/2024 2,315.00 1,175.00 975.00 1,267.00
3"-5.9" 2020/2021 4,277.00 1,440.00 850.00 3,168.00
3"-5.9" 2021/2022 4,386.00 1,440.00 900.00 3,168.00
3"-5.9" 2022/2023 4,466.00 1,525.00 950.00 3,168.00
3"-5.9" 2023/2024 4,571.00 1,525.00 1,000.00 3,168.00
6"-7.9" 2020/2021 6,110.00 1,770.00 950.00 4,435.00
6"-7.9" 2021/2022 6,240.00 1,770.00 1,000.00 4,435.00
6"-7.9" 2022/2023 6,380.00 1,875.00 1,050.00 4,435.00
6"-7.9" 2023/2024 6,530.00 1,875.00 1,100.00 4,435.00
8"-9.9" 2020/2021 ™ 2,100.00 1,000.00 5,702.00
8"-9.9" 2021/2022 ™ 2,100.00 1,100.00 5,702.00
8"-9.9" 2022/2023 ™ 2,225.00 1,200.00 5,702.00
8"-9.9" 2023/2024 ™ 2,225.00 1,300.00 5,702.00
10" and Up 2020/2021 ™ ™ ™ 6,969.00
10" and Up 2021/2022 ™ ™ ™ 6,969.00
10" and Up 2022/2023 ™ ™ ™ 6,969.00
10" and Up 2023/2024 ™ ™ ™ 6,969.00
Salting Flat Rate Pricing
2020/2021 680.00 275.00 300.00 2,976.00
2021/2022 692.00 275.00 400.00 2,976.00
2022/2023 708.00 290.00 400.00 2,976.00
2023/2024 724.00 290.00 500.00 2,976.00
4X4 Vehicle w/ 8 Foot Plow
2020/2021 170.00 92.00 120.00 115.00
2021/2022 173.00 92.00 120.00 115.00
2022/2023 177.00 97.00 130.00 115.00
2023/2024 181.00 97.00 140.00 115.00

The City of Aurora reserves the rig

ht to reject any or all bids, to waive technicality, informality or irregularity in the bids

received. The City further reserves the right to award the bid to the lowest responsible bidder whose offer best responds
in quality, fitness, and capacity to the requirements of the proposed work or usage and therefore is in the best interest of

the City.




CITY OF AURORA

Request for Proposal 20-32 Tabulation

Snow and Ice Control Services of Various Parking Lots
FINAL-#10 Thrive Center
Opened 2:00 pm, June 3, 2020

Montgomery Semper Fi Yard Tovar Snow
Landscaping,Inc. RB Enterprises Service, Inc. Professionals East

Bristol, IL USA Aurora, IL Aurora, IL Dundee, IL
Flat Rate Pricing
Up to 2.9" 2020/2021 135.00 85.00 No Bid 142.00
Up to 2.9" 2021/2022 135.00 85.00 No Bid 142.00
Up to 2.9" 2022/2023 150.00 90.00 No Bid 142.00
Up to 2.9" 2023/2024 150.00 90.00 No Bid 142.00
3"-5.9" 2020/2021 155.00 110.00 No Bid 354.00
3"-5.9" 2021/2022 155.00 110.00 No Bid 354.00
3"-5.9" 2022/2023 175.00 115.00 No Bid 354.00
3"-5.9" 2023/2024 175.00 115.00 No Bid 354.00
6"-7.9" 2020/2021 175.00 135.00 No Bid 496.00
6"-7.9" 2021/2022 175.00 135.00 No Bid 496.00
6"-7.9" 2022/2023 195.00 145.00 No Bid 496.00
6"-7.9" 2023/2024 195.00 145.00 No Bid 496.00
8"-9.9" 2020/2021 195.00 160.00 No Bid 638.00
8"-9.9" 2021/2022 195.00 160.00 No Bid 638.00
8"-9.9" 2022/2023 220.00 170.00 No Bid 638.00
8"-9.9" 2023/2024 220.00 170.00 No Bid 638.00
10" and Up 2020/2021 230.00 ™ No Bid 780.00
10" and Up 2021/2022 230.00 ™ No Bid 780.00
10" and Up 2022/2023 250.00 ™ No Bid 780.00
10" and Up 2023/2024 250.00 ™ No Bid 780.00
Salting Flat Rate Pricing
2020/2021 65.00 30.00 No Bid 228.00
2021/2022 65.00 30.00 No Bid 228.00
2022/2023 68.00 35.00 No Bid 228.00
2023/2024 68.00 35.00 No Bid 228.00
4X4 Vehicle w/ 8 Foot Plow
2020/2021 105.00 92.00 120.00 115.00
2021/2022 105.00 92.00 120.00 115.00
2022/2023 110.00 97.00 130.00 115.00
2023/2024 110.00 97.00 140.00 115.00

The City of Aurora reserves the rig

ht to reject any or all bids, to waive technicality, informality or irregularity in the bids

received. The City further reserves the right to award the bid to the lowest responsible bidder whose offer best responds
in quality, fitness, and capacity to the requirements of the proposed work or usage and therefore is in the best interest of

the City.




CITY OF AURORA

Request for Proposal 20-32 Tabulation

Snow and Ice Control Services of Various Parking Lots
FINAL-#11 Parking Lot X
Opened 2:00 pm, June 3, 2020

Semper Fi Yard Tovar Snow
RB Enterprises Service, Inc. Professionals East
USA Aurora, IL Aurora, IL Dundee, IL
Flat Rate Pricing
Up to 2.9" 2020/2021 195.00 250.00 220.00
Up to 2.9" 2021/2022 195.00 275.00 220.00
Up to 2.9" 2022/2023 205.00 325.00 220.00
Up to 2.9" 2023/2024 205.00 350.00 220.00
3"-5.9" 2020/2021 255.00 325.00 245.00
3"-5.9" 2021/2022 255.00 350.00 245.00
3"-5.9" 2022/2023 265.00 390.00 245.00
3"-5.9" 2023/2024 265.00 425.00 245.00
6"-7.9" 2020/2021 315.00 375.00 391.00
6"-7.9" 2021/2022 315.00 400.00 391.00
6"-7.9" 2022/2023 335.00 440.00 391.00
6"-7.9" 2023/2024 335.00 475.00 391.00
8"-9.9" 2020/2021 375.00 450.00 465.00
8"-9.9" 2021/2022 375.00 490.00 465.00
8"-9.9" 2022/2023 395.00 525.00 465.00
8"-9.9" 2023/2024 395.00 550.00 465.00
10" and Up 2020/2021 ™ ™ 465.00
10" and Up 2021/2022 ™ ™ 465.00
10" and Up 2022/2023 ™ ™ 465.00
10" and Up 2023/2024 ™ ™ 465.00
Salting Flat Rate Pricing
2020/2021 55.00 200.00 294.00
2021/2022 55.00 200.00 294.00
2022/2023 60.00 300.00 294.00
2023/2024 60.00 350.00 294.00
4X4 Vehicle w/ 8 Foot Plow
2020/2021 92.00 120.00 115.00
2021/2022 92.00 120.00 115.00
2022/2023 97.00 130.00 115.00
2023/2024 97.00 140.00 115.00

The City of Aurora reserves the rig

ht to reject any or all bids, to waive technicality, informality or irregularity in the bids

received. The City further reserves the right to award the bid to the lowest responsible bidder whose offer best responds
in quality, fitness, and capacity to the requirements of the proposed work or usage and therefore is in the best interest of

the City.




CITY OF AURORA

Request for Proposal 20-32 Tabulation

Snow and Ice Control Services of Various Parking Lots
FINAL-#12 Parking Lot A
Opened 2:00 pm, June 3, 2020

Semper Fi Yard Tovar Snow
RB Enterprises Service, Inc. Professionals East
USA Aurora, IL Aurora, IL Dundee, IL
Flat Rate Pricing
Up to 2.9" 2020/2021 305.00 200.00 151.00
Up to 2.9" 2021/2022 305.00 275.00 151.00
Up to 2.9" 2022/2023 325.00 325.00 151.00
Up to 2.9" 2023/2024 325.00 370.00 151.00
3"-5.9" 2020/2021 395.00 275.00 168.00
3"-5.9" 2021/2022 395.00 325.00 168.00
3"-5.9" 2022/2023 415.00 375.00 168.00
3"-5.9" 2023/2024 415.00 400.00 168.00
6"-7.9" 2020/2021 485.00 350.00 269.00
6"-7.9" 2021/2022 485.00 400.00 269.00
6"-7.9" 2022/2023 515.00 450.00 269.00
6"-7.9" 2023/2024 515.00 490.00 269.00
8"-9.9" 2020/2021 575.00 390.00 320.00
8"-9.9" 2021/2022 575.00 425.00 320.00
8"-9.9" 2022/2023 605.00 475.00 320.00
8"-9.9" 2023/2024 605.00 550.00 320.00
10" and Up 2020/2021 ™ ™ 320.00
10" and Up 2021/2022 ™ ™ 320.00
10" and Up 2022/2023 ™ ™ 320.00
10" and Up 2023/2024 ™ ™ 320.00
Salting Flat Rate Pricing
2020/2021 60.00 200.00 202.00
2021/2022 60.00 200.00 202.00
2022/2023 65.00 250.00 202.00
2023/2024 65.00 300.00 202.00
4X4 Vehicle w/ 8 Foot Plow
2020/2021 92.00 120.00 115.00
2021/2022 92.00 120.00 115.00
2022/2023 97.00 130.00 115.00
2023/2024 97.00 140.00 115.00

The City of Aurora reserves the rig

ht to reject any or all bids, to waive technicality, informality or irregularity in the bids

received. The City further reserves the right to award the bid to the lowest responsible bidder whose offer best responds
in quality, fitness, and capacity to the requirements of the proposed work or usage and therefore is in the best interest of

the City.




CITY OF AURORA

Request for Proposal 20-32 Tabulation

Snow and Ice Control Services of Various Parking Lots
FINAL-#13 Parking Lot C
Opened 2:00 pm, June 3, 2020

Semper Fi Yard Tovar Snow
RB Enterprises Service, Inc. Professionals East
USA Aurora, IL Aurora, IL Dundee, IL
Flat Rate Pricing
Up to 2.9" 2020/2021 130.00 115.00 95.00
Up to 2.9" 2021/2022 130.00 150.00 95.00
Up to 2.9" 2022/2023 140.00 175.00 95.00
Up to 2.9" 2023/2024 140.00 200.00 95.00
3"-5.9" 2020/2021 170.00 150.00 105.00
3"-5.9" 2021/2022 170.00 175.00 105.00
3"-5.9" 2022/2023 180.00 200.00 105.00
3"-5.9" 2023/2024 180.00 225.00 105.00
6"-7.9" 2020/2021 210.00 175.00 168.00
6"-7.9" 2021/2022 210.00 200.00 168.00
6"-7.9" 2022/2023 225.00 225.00 168.00
6"-7.9" 2023/2024 225.00 250.00 168.00
8"-9.9" 2020/2021 250.00 200.00 200.00
8"-9.9" 2021/2022 250.00 225.00 200.00
8"-9.9" 2022/2023 265.00 250.00 200.00
8"-9.9" 2023/2024 265.00 275.00 200.00
10" and Up 2020/2021 ™ ™ 200.00
10" and Up 2021/2022 ™ ™ 200.00
10" and Up 2022/2023 ™ ™ 200.00
10" and Up 2023/2024 ™ ™ 200.00
Salting Flat Rate Pricing
2020/2021 35.00 100.00 126.00
2021/2022 35.00 125.00 126.00
2022/2023 40.00 150.00 126.00
2023/2024 40.00 175.00 126.00
4X4 Vehicle w/ 8 Foot Plow
2020/2021 92.00 120.00 115.00
2021/2022 92.00 120.00 115.00
2022/2023 97.00 130.00 115.00
2023/2024 97.00 140.00 115.00

The City of Aurora reserves the rig

ht to reject any or all bids, to waive technicality, informality or irregularity in the bids

received. The City further reserves the right to award the bid to the lowest responsible bidder whose offer best responds
in quality, fitness, and capacity to the requirements of the proposed work or usage and therefore is in the best interest of

the City.




CITY OF AURORA

Request for Proposal 20-32 Tabulation

Snow and Ice Control Services of Various Parking Lots
FINAL-#14 Parking Lot H
Opened 2:00 pm, June 3, 2020

Semper Fi Yard Tovar Snow
RB Enterprises Service, Inc. Professionals East
USA Aurora, IL Aurora, IL Dundee, IL
Flat Rate Pricing
Up to 2.9" 2020/2021 105.00 115.00 95.00
Up to 2.9" 2021/2022 105.00 150.00 95.00
Up to 2.9" 2022/2023 110.00 175.00 95.00
Up to 2.9" 2023/2024 110.00 200.00 95.00
3"-5.9" 2020/2021 135.00 150.00 105.00
3"-5.9" 2021/2022 135.00 175.00 105.00
3"-5.9" 2022/2023 140.00 200.00 105.00
3"-5.9" 2023/2024 140.00 225.00 105.00
6"-7.9" 2020/2021 165.00 175.00 168.00
6"-7.9" 2021/2022 165.00 200.00 168.00
6"-7.9" 2022/2023 175.00 225.00 168.00
6"-7.9" 2023/2024 175.00 250.00 168.00
8"-9.9" 2020/2021 195.00 200.00 200.00
8"-9.9" 2021/2022 195.00 225.00 200.00
8"-9.9" 2022/2023 205.00 250.00 200.00
8"-9.9" 2023/2024 205.00 275.00 200.00
10" and Up 2020/2021 ™ ™ 200.00
10" and Up 2021/2022 ™ ™ 200.00
10" and Up 2022/2023 ™ ™ 200.00
10" and Up 2023/2024 ™ ™ 200.00
Salting Flat Rate Pricing
2020/2021 30.00 100.00 126.00
2021/2022 30.00 125.00 126.00
2022/2023 35.00 150.00 126.00
2023/2024 35.00 175.00 126.00
4X4 Vehicle w/ 8 Foot Plow
2020/2021 92.00 No Bid 115.00
2021/2022 92.00 No Bid 115.00
2022/2023 97.00 No Bid 115.00
2023/2024 97.00 No Bid 115.00

The City of Aurora reserves the rig

ht to reject any or all bids, to waive technicality, informality or irregularity in the bids

received. The City further reserves the right to award the bid to the lowest responsible bidder whose offer best responds
in quality, fitness, and capacity to the requirements of the proposed work or usage and therefore is in the best interest of

the City.




CITY OF AURORA

Request for Proposal 20-32 Tabulation

Snow and Ice Control Services of Various Parking Lots

FINAL-#15 Parking Lo

tS

Opened 2:00 pm, June 3, 2020

Semper Fi Yard Tovar Snow
RB Enterprises Service, Inc. Professionals East
USA Aurora, IL Aurora, IL Dundee, IL
Flat Rate Pricing
Up to 2.9" 2020/2021 120.00 115.00 95.00
Up to 2.9" 2021/2022 120.00 150.00 95.00
Up to 2.9" 2022/2023 125.00 175.00 95.00
Up to 2.9" 2023/2024 125.00 200.00 95.00
3"-5.9" 2020/2021 155.00 150.00 105.00
3"-5.9" 2021/2022 155.00 175.00 105.00
3"-5.9" 2022/2023 160.00 200.00 105.00
3"-5.9" 2023/2024 160.00 225.00 105.00
6"-7.9" 2020/2021 190.00 175.00 168.00
6"-7.9" 2021/2022 190.00 200.00 168.00
6"-7.9" 2022/2023 200.00 225.00 168.00
6"-7.9" 2023/2024 200.00 250.00 168.00
8"-9.9" 2020/2021 225.00 200.00 200.00
8"-9.9" 2021/2022 225.00 225.00 200.00
8"-9.9" 2022/2023 235.00 250.00 200.00
8"-9.9" 2023/2024 235.00 275.00 200.00
10" and Up 2020/2021 ™ ™ 200.00
10" and Up 2021/2022 ™ ™ 200.00
10" and Up 2022/2023 ™ ™ 200.00
10" and Up 2023/2024 ™ ™ 200.00
Salting Flat Rate Pricing
2020/2021 35.00 100.00 126.00
2021/2022 35.00 125.00 126.00
2022/2023 40.00 150.00 126.00
2023/2024 40.00 175.00 126.00
4X4 Vehicle w/ 8 Foot Plow
2020/2021 92.00 120.00 115.00
2021/2022 92.00 120.00 115.00
2022/2023 97.00 130.00 115.00
2023/2024 97.00 140.00 115.00

The City of Aurora reserves the rig

ht to reject any or all bids, to waive technicality, informality or irregularity in the bids

received. The City further reserves the right to award the bid to the lowest responsible bidder whose offer best responds
in quality, fitness, and capacity to the requirements of the proposed work or usage and therefore is in the best interest of

the City.




