Bid Tabulation

‘ WEDNESDAY, SEPTEMBER 5,2018 @ 3 PM

40-018 G

ASOLINE

[#1) GASOLINE

(#3) Bio Diesel #2 - B5

(#5) - 50% - 50% Winter
Blend

(#6) Winter Blend Diesel -
20% - 80% Winter Blend

B. GENERATOR

REGULAR GASOLINE - Multi-

Bio Diesel Fuel #2 (85) Multi-

Bio Diesel Fuel #2 (B5) -

Bio Diesel Fuel #2 - PreBlend

(#1) Bio Diesel Fuel #2 (B5) Mutti

(#2) Bio Diesal Fuel #2 (B5) Fuell

BASE BID Location City of Aurora, KDOT, | Location - City of Aurora, KDOT, |PreBlend Winter 50% #1 - 50% #2 | Winter 20% 1 - B0% #2 - City of > Pre-Blend Winter 50% #1 50% #2
and Sheriff and Sheriff KDOT Aurora Logations » Tank Wagen Multi-Locations - Tank Wagan
OPIS $2.0429 QPIS $2.2712 OPIS $2.3515 QPIS $2.3033 OPIS §2.2762 OPIS $2.3565
MARKUP OFIS + Markup MARKUP OPIS + Markup MARKUP ‘OPIS + Markup MARKUP OPS +Markiup § pacicup OFIS + Markup MARKUP | —OFPIS+ Markup
VENDOR TOTAL PRICEIGAL TOTAL PRICEIGAL TOTAL PRICEIGAL TOTAL PRICE/GAL TOTAL PRICEIGAL| TOTAL PRICEIGAL)
Mansfield Oil Co - Gainesville, GA $0.0283 §20712 $0. 00587 $22770 ($0.0070) $2.3445 $0.0094 $2.3127 $0.2486 $25248 $0.3480 $27045
Petroleum Traders - Fort Wayne, IN $0.0212 $2.0641 $0. 035:; $2.3085 $0.0584 $24079 $0.0448 §2.3481 $0.6939 $2.9701 $0.7139 $30704
Heritage Petroleum - Evansville, IN $0.0750 $2.1179 $0.0750 $2.3462 $0.0750 $24285 $0.0750 $2.3783 $1.0500 §3.3262 $1.0500 $3.4065
Blue Petroleum Inc. - Mundelein, IL $0.0490 $2.0919 $0.0690 $2.3402 $0.0690 $24205 $0.0690 $2.3723 $0.1500 $2.4262 $0.1500 $2.5065
Al Warren Oil Co - Hammond, IN $0.0620 $2.1049 $0.0620 $2.3332 $0.1120 $24635 $0.1120 $2.4153 $2.0000 $4.2762 $2.1000 $4.4565
Gas Depot - Morton Grove, IL $0.0269 $2.0698 $0.0344 $2.3056 $0.0419 $23934 $0.0419 $2.3452 No Bid Ne Bid
Feece Ol Co - Mincoka, IL $0.0350 $2.0779 $0.0350 $2.3062 $0.0350 $2.3885 $0.0350 $2.3383 $0.9500 §3.2262 $0.9500 $3.3065
WAGGON DELIVERY - Aboveground Tank (FP) WAGGON DELIVERY - Generatoers & Airport (City of Auroa) ...
(#2) GASOLINE (#4) - Bio Diesel #2 - (B5) (#3) Bio Diesel #2 - B5 (#4) GASOLINE
= = —— =
GENERATOR: Bio Diesel Fuel 82
REGULAR GASOLINE - TANK Bio Diesel Fuel #2 (B5) - (Forest REGULAR GASOLINE - AIRPORT,
WAGGON (Forest Preserve) Preserve) Lo C"’x:;::“" ~Tank 1 City of Aurara. Tank Wagen
OPIS $2.0429 OPIS $2.2712 QOPIS $2.2782 OPIS $2.0429
OPIS + Markup GPiS + Markup OPIS + Marky OP1S + Markup
VENDOR MARKUP | At priceioar] """ [ToTAL PRICEIGAL MARKUP | oTa priceiGaL] "o 0" [TOTAL PRICEIGAL
Mansfield Oil Co - Gainesville, GA $0.2646 $2.3075 $0.2486 $2.5198 $0.2486 §2.5248 $0.2646 $2.3075
Petroleum Traders - Forl Wayne, IN $0.4524 $2.4853 $0.5272 $2.7984 $0.7800 $3.0562 $0.7800 $2.8229
Heritage Petroleun - Evansville, IN $0.3500 $23029 $0.2500 $2.5212 $1.0500 $3.3262 $1.0500 $3.0929
Blue Peraleuminc, - Mundelein,IL___| 50.1300 | $21729 | 50.1500 | 524212 501500 | sa4es2 | 501300 | s21728
Al Warren Oil Co - Hammond, IN $0.4000 $2.4429 $0.4000 $2.6712 $2.0000 $4.5248 $2.0000 $4.3075
Gas Depol - Morton Grove, IL $0.2769 $2.3198 $0.3915 $2.6627 No Bid No Bid
Feece Oil Co - Minooka, IL $0.1350 $21779 $0.1350 $2.4062 $0.9500 542762 $0.9500 $4.0429
INTERGOVERNMENTAL UNITS
(A) GASOLINE (B) Bio Diesel Fuel #2 (BS5) {C) 50% -50% Winter Blend

WAGGON DELIVERY (200 -5000 | TANK DELWERY (7000 - 10000 | WAGGON DELIVERY (200 - 5000 | TANK DELIVERY (7000 -10000 | WAGON DELIVERY (200 -5000 | TANK DELIVERY (7000 - 10000
GALLONS) LONS) GALLONS} GALLONS) GALLONS) GALLONS)
CPIS $2.0429 OPIS $2.0429 OPIS $2.2712 OPIS §2.2712 OPIS $2.3515 OPIS $2.3515
VENDOR AP | e PARKUP | | MARKUP | ntecar] "™UP v smetoa] "NV [Tora pmceiam] "ARUP [Tt priceo]

Mansfield Oil Co - Gainesville, GA $0.2846 $2.3275 $0.0683 $2.1112 $0.2685 $25398 $0.0430 §23142 $0.3680 $2.7195 $0.0285 $2 3800
Petroleum Traders - Fort Wayne, IN $0.7800 $2.8229 $0.0212 $2.0641 $0.7800 $30512 $0.0353 §2.3065 $0.7800 $3.1315 $0.0584 $2 4079
Heritage Petraleum - Evansville, IN No Bid $0.1050 $2.1479 No Bid $0.1050 $2.3762 Mo Bid $0.1050 $2.4585
Blue Petroleum Inc. - Mundelein, IL $0.1300 $2.1729 $0.0430 $2.0919 $0.1500 $24212 $0.0690 §2.3402 $0.1500 $2.5015 $0.0690 $2.4205
Al Warren ©il Co - Hammond, IN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid
Gas Depot - Morton Grove, IL $0.2769 $2.3198 $0.0269 $2.0698 $0.3915 $26627 $0.0344 §2.3056 §0.2919 $2.6434 $0.0419 $2.3934
Feece Oil Co - Minooka, IL $0.2350 $2.2779 $0.0350 $2.0779 $0.2350 $25062 $0.0350 §2.3062 §0.2350 $2.5665 $0.0350 $2 3855

** Same OPIS report dated 8/31/2018 ™



