City of Aurora, IL

AULL A Purchasing
. Jolene Coulter, Director of Purchasing

44 E Downer Place, Aurora, IL 60502

[GRAYBAR ELECTRIC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
ITB No. 26-004

Electrical Lighting Materials
RESPONSE DEADLINE: February 11, 2026 at 11:00 am
Report Generated: Thursday, March 12, 2026

Graybar Electric Response

CONTACT INFORMATION
Company:
Graybar Electric

Email:
adam.morrison@graybar.com

Contact:
Adam Morrison

Address:
1 Pierce Place Suite 800
Itasca, IL 60143

Phone:
N/A

Website:
www.graybar.com

Submission Date:
Feb 11, 2026 10:52 AM (Central Time)


http://www.graybar.com/
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ADDENDA CONFIRMATION

Addendum #1
Confirmed Feb 11, 2026 8:10 AM by Adam Morrison

QUESTIONNAIRE

1. Contact Information*
Pass

Please download the below documents, complete, and upload.

e COA Contact Information.docx

Aurora_Bid.docx
Aurora_Bid.docx

2. References*

Pass

Include Municipality, Address, Phone Number, Contact Person, Date of Project for each reference

City of Aurora - 44 E Downer Pl, Aurora, IL 60505 - Jason Bauer 630-774-3321 - Multiple downtown lighting projects in 2024 & 2025
Village of Addison - 1491 W Jeffrey Dr, Addison - Eddie Paladino 630-464-1083 - Spring 2024

Village of Northbrook - 655 Huehl Road Northbrook - Joe Rizzo - 847.571.0200 - Summer 2024 and Summer 2025

Village of Mt. Prospect - 1700 West Central Road, Mount Prospect - Casey Botterman 847.870.5640 - August 2025

3. Sub-Contractor List*
Pass
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https://government-project.s3.us-west-2.amazonaws.com/163911/5c8c022e-d61b-4583-8a78-1938410eee36_COA_Contact_Information.docx
https://www.bing.com/ck/a?!&&p=e05912de7d24709f36ea5824bc3b6bace1445cfffcc82b17df98defcc0da71b6JmltdHM9MTc3MDc2ODAwMA&ptn=3&ver=2&hsh=4&fclid=02d8d4ac-6094-6f38-13d4-c257618e6e07&u=a1L21hcHM_Jm1lcGk9NTZ-fkVtYmVkZGVkfkFkZHJlc3NfTGluayZ0eT0xOCZxPUNpdHklMjBvZiUyMEF1cm9yYSUyQyUyMElMJTIwR292ZXJubWVudCZzcz15cGlkLllONUZBMDdCNTNDMjYzMTQxOCZwcG9pcz00MS43NTY2NTI4MzIwMzEyNV8tODguMzE0NTkwNDU0MTAxNTZfQ2l0eSUyMG9mJTIwQXVyb3JhJTJDJTIwSUwlMjBHb3Zlcm5tZW50X1lONUZBMDdCNTNDMjYzMTQxOH4mY3A9NDEuNzU2NjUzfi04OC4zMTQ1OSZ2PTImc1Y9MSZGT1JNPU1QU1JQTA&ntb=1
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Please provide the following information for each subcontractor. If you do not have subcontractors, please write "N/A"
Company:

Address:

City, State, Zip:

Phone Number:

Contact Person:

n/a

4. Eligibility*

Pass

By signing this Proposal, the Proposer hereby certifies that they are not barred from bidding on this Proposal as a result of a violation
of Article 33E, Public Bids of the Illinois Criminal Code of 1961, as amended (lllinois Compiled Statutes, 720 ILCS 5/33E-1).

Confirmed

5. Bidder's Tax Certification*
Pass

The Bidder's Executing Officer, being first duly sworn on oath, deposes and states that all statements made herein are made on behalf
of the Bidder, that this despondent is authorized to make them and that the statements contained herein are true and correct.

Bidder deposes, states and certifies that Bidder is not barred from contracting with any unit of local government in the State of lllinois
as result of a delinquency in payment of any tax administered by the lllinois Department of Revenue unless Bidder is contesting, in
accordance with the procedures established by the appropriate statute, its liability for the tax or the amount of the tax, all as provided
for in accordance with 65 ILCS 5/11-42.1-1.

Confirmed
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6. Bidder's Certification*
Pass

I/We hereby certify that:

A. A complete set of bid papers, as intended, has been received, and that I/We will abide by the contents and/or information received
and/or contained herein.

B. I/We have not entered into any collusion or other unethical practices with any person, firm, or employee of the City which would in
any way be construed as unethical business practice.

C. I/We have adopted a written sexual harassment policy which is in accordance with the requirements of Federal, State and local
laws, regulations and policies and further certify that I/We are also in compliance with all other equal employment requirements
contained in Public Act 87-1257 (effective July 1, 1993) 775 ILCS 5/2-105 (A).

D. As applicable, I/We are in compliance with the most current “Prevailing Rate” of wages for laborers, mechanics and other workers
as required by the State of lllinois Department of Labor.

E. I/We operate a drug free environment and drugs are not allowed in the workplace or satellite locations as well as City of Aurora
sites in accordance with the Drug Free Workplace Act of January, 1992.

F. The Bidder is not barred from bidding on the Project, or entering into this contract as a result of a violation of either Section 33E-3
or 33E-4 of the Illinois Criminal Code, or any similar offense of “bid rigging” or “bid rotating” of any state or the United States.

G. As applicable, I/We will submit, for all contracts in excess of $25,000.00, a certificate indicating participation in apprenticeship and
training programs approved and registered with the United States Department of Labor.

H. I/We will abide by all other Federal, State and local codes, rules, regulations, ordinances and statutes.

Confirmed

7. Local Vendor Preference Application*
Pass

Please download the below documents, complete, and upload.
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e COA 2024 Local Preference V...
COA 2024 Local_Preference_Vendor_ Application FILLABLE (2).pdf

8. Standard City of Aurora Contract*
Please download the below documents, complete, and upload.

e Sample Standard Contract IT...
adffffa7-5a39-4d12-9253-2a27d658d2cb_Sample_Standard_Contract_ITB.pdf

9. Additional Information
No response submitted

PRICE TABLES
COBRA HEAD FIXTURES

Line Item Product Code Description Quantity Unitof  Unit Cost Total Lead Time No Bid
Measure

1 ERL1008C740EGRAYI GE Cobra Head - Gray 23 EA $210.00 | $4,830.00 |6 Weeks
(57W)

2 ERL1005C740EGRAYI GE Cobra Head - Gray 23 EA $430.00 | $9,890.00 |6 Weeks
(39w)

3 ERL2018C740DBLCKAIR | GE Cobra Head - Black 23 EA $430.00 | $9,890.00 |6 Weeks
(125W)

4 ERL2018C740DGRAYAIR | GE Cobra Head - Gray 23 EA $200.00 | $4,600.00 |6 Weeks
(125W)

5 ERL2H18C730DBLCKAIR | GE Cobra Head - Black 23 EA $438.00 |$10,074.00 | 6 Weeks
(146W, 480V)
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https://government-project.s3.us-west-2.amazonaws.com/163911/d4cff10d-3978-4911-81b3-7df9e0579eb4_COA_2024_Local_Preference_Vendor_Application_FILLABLE.pdf?X-Amz-Algorithm=AWS4-HMAC-SHA256&X-Amz-Content-Sha256=UNSIGNED-PAYLOAD&X-Amz-Credential=ASIA47RIURE4O2UMIFX6%2F20260312%2Fus-west-2%2Fs3%2Faws4_request&X-Amz-Date=20260312T203710Z&X-Amz-Expires=72000&X-Amz-Security-Token=IQoJb3JpZ2luX2VjELT%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2FwEaCXVzLXdlc3QtMiJHMEUCIQCSkM3eSTcD0k2yj%2FY8qv57Ml3HpXBOvRYgURqd%2FL3stAIgeIlmmcVNbRZH%2BNsE9JC4DjHjcJSFB2JsVdrOtKjedrwqhQUIfRACGgw4OTIzNjQ2ODc2NzIiDNE0YfrqKJuwa8cpjiriBDLSg%2FJ6KWlLmjD7K3bGRWmT8%2BgwEwHbOs4lQqrsoF8I4WUOE6S9RpMVSJz%2BfjleYWLIYp3F65L3seb7MluK7W%2FfHMnnB0LKvcv84HQ7GH9hDD4wNCOqODeeL%2B2ISivwSZwm0bAWDlXOW2R1WARievwcpAVrlES4sMTBnBGSU8QuoZjI6nxAAx%2FFdKmicXZMoC%2BZC%2BpRnk7kimEyG79%2BRTGUIgLhj8sEEIHlr1iAOgBvWImyGZfc%2FrTl8rruC8u3VGP566Eu7X5fQVPJRPwHXrGyJCj3VcwIlx6K9WwgcQ%2FB%2Bd80yqfnpFLGWg2O7XY9FBywAoDOwv%2B4uTjW4GbYbPM5BFa3fNWqxBUZ8z5eiKbYjO52CNwUZ2zM2JF4hdrFyibu%2BsjCpjdmVv5su5Fc20%2Bks4Sws5rkSzLX50L2NQZ0NP%2FHW7bz0QI%2FlnAQ3S5qkG9U8Rfc85PQj1pnP7On9Vmf0GymHZBzMZWMht0xqvigtAGaod87Ma4PyBR898yrI03tiMmnbYptCDqdOxShtYfJoz2xZAE4OhKiOgeOuUZjRyahhPXzVrm%2B0qAQAJoW8Ee7NCT004KpQS7D50vyV8WIMkgfSebhGixwPLclYigxezlp62A5TWauDDivntMafRPoXPY72IjNYVdRe2Ltr7pRXgCmuZq6PVKhP2hVNoBguYVQoiI9Yya6m61BccFIY8q8JIot9fn%2BPIcZUXyfubjtHARLSdMjaM70mkRUd3HW3lF%2BimjFTDr6Gz0ZayzWfA430FPHDxD3B27A3gfKj04r9Nv0MAhTMrqob3NcYq8fg%2BowurDMzQY6mQFd16yh60Rr7j7AMRACQUvLR2rv5EJuSorInsyjAjZMW%2B7uAqs1h22eZZWV3I0mzOk4ImXELWxCY719uEl4kMHklhLUBOi54Rj1RYQ7KHxfgEUdPMcnmBbKAcq7U24DUFIr%2Bs5WQDynZq33cnxkGb%2BpS7qQZEza%2BgMImylgvj%2BFXbzchqSxXlvNRUDUf8uOLf5OCWrKlFm%2FqEI%3D&X-Amz-Signature=a95a4ed159b54c45b10b12b5365bb2e661a4cd55ddf68c2fc2211c7f4daf2fc4&X-Amz-SignedHeaders=host&response-content-disposition=attachment%3B%20filename%3D%22COA_2024_Local_Preference_Vendor_Application_FILLABLE.pdf%22&x-id=GetObject
https://government-project.s3.us-west-2.amazonaws.com/228465/adffffa7-5a39-4d12-9253-2a27d658d2cb_Sample_Standard_Contract_ITB.pdf
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Line Item Product Code Description Quantity Unitof  Unit Cost Total Lead Time No Bid
Measure
6 ERL2H18C730DGRAYAIR | GE Cobra Head - Gray 23 EA $438.00 |$10,074.00 | 6 Weeks
(146W, 480V)
TOTAL $49,358.00
DRIVERS
Line Item Product Code Description Quantity Unitof  Unit Cost Total Lead Time  No Bid
Measure
7 35-225097R30 290MA | 39W Replacement Drivers 200 EA $66.50 |$13,300.00
8 GED100MC/VDIP700S | 100W Replacement Drivers 200 EA $74.00 |$14,800.00
9 GED150/MC/VDIP1050S | 150W Replacement Drivers 200 EA $59.50 [$11,900.00
10 35-225096R28 490MA | 180W Replacement Drivers 50 EA $66.50 $3,325.00
TOTAL $43,325.00

POLES, BOLLARDS, BASES AND OTHER FIXTURES

Line Item | Product Code Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Lead Time  No Bid

Measure

11 SAL-CC-12'-BK |Sentry 12' Decorative Aluminum Pole EA No Bid No Bid X
W/2" DAIM X
3" TALL
TENON, LESS
ANCHOR
BOLTS NOTE -
4" DIA, 10" BC,
BLACK FINISH

11 CP16636 Hadco 12' Decorative Aluminum Pole 3 EA $3,928.57 | $11,785.71
ALTERNATE
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Line ltem

Product Code

Description

Quantity

Unit of
Measure

Unit Cost

Total

Lead Time  No Bid

12

SAL-CC-16'-BK
W/2" DAIM X
3" TALL
TENON, LESS
ANCHOR
BOLTS NOTE -
4" DIA, 10" BC,
BLACK FINISH

Sentry 16' Decorative Aluminum Pole

EA

No Bid

No Bid

12
ALTERNATE

CP16636B

Hadco 16' Decorative Aluminum Pole

EA

$4,412.24

$8,824.48

13

DS50-
700A240-4'
LMA-FP/GV-
HH-NC-LAB
(no finial)
(EXISTING 14"
BC/1" ABS)

Valmont 20' Steel Pole

EA

No Bid

No Bid

13
ALTERNATE

P1700-S-8-
JRFE2229-2

Ameron 20' Steel Pole

EA

$2,527.55

$10,110.20

14

120040404UB
Brookhaven

Valmont 12' Aluminum Pole

EA

No Bid

No Bid

14
ALTERNATE

APSMDS-18-
12.00-E5-
TN2.38-4.00-
Ccu

Post

25

EA

$3,814.29

$95,357.25

15

270860808t4F
(Satin)

Valmont 30' Aluminum Pole

EA

No Bid

No Bid

16

DS210-
900A400-(1)-
8'LMA-FP/BK-
HH-NC-AB (no
finial)

Valmont Pole (1 Arm)

EA

No Bid

No Bid

[GRAYBAR ELECTRIC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
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Line ltem | Product Code Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Lead Time  No Bid

Measure

16 P1700-S-8- Ameron 40' Pole (1 Arm) 10 EA $4,311.22 | $43,112.20
ALTERNATE |JRFE2229-1

17 DS210- Valmont Pole (2 Arm) EA No Bid No Bid X
900A400-(2)-
8'LMA-FP/BK-
HH-NC-AB (no
finial)

17 P1700-D-8/8- | Ameron 40' Pole (2 Arm) 10 EA $4,614.29 | $46,142.90
ALTERNATE |JRFE2229-1

18 E-250-APH-G | Stresscrete Pole 30 EA $2,937.00 | $88,110.00
(20)
19 K833- King Fixture 10 EA $2,429.00 | $24,290.00
75(SSL)8060
120/277V
(black)
20 LPBA-40 LED LV Fixture EA No Bid No Bid X
4K-V-BK
20 C16248 Hadco Fixture 25 EA $1,579.59 | $39,489.75
ALTENRATE
21 SCP-NB- Sentry Fixture EA No Bid No Bid X
LEDV29BP-07A
803 DR KHT 3
TLR7 BK
21 ALMPCL- Spring City Fixture 20 EA $1,866.33 | $37,326.60
ALTERNATE | LEO40-EVX-
2G2-30-CR3-

YKSF-TR7P-CU
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Line ltem | Product Code Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Lead Time  No Bid
Measure

22 SAL-B-BOL- Sentry Bollard EA No Bid No Bid X
SLOT-INC
(gloss black)

22 DBDMDS-18- | Spring City Bollard 5 EA $3,359.18 | $16,795.90

ALTERNATE | 3.58-LT-

LEO25/EVX/X1-
45--CN5-YCLF-
PP-CB

23 TB1-17 Valmont Breakaway Transformer Base Aluminum 12 EA $684.00 | $8,208.00

24 TB5-9 Valmont Breakaway Transformer Base Aluminum 12 EA $672.00 $8,064.00

25 TB2N-1 Pelco Transformer Base Aluminum 12 EA $785.00 $9,420.00

TOTAL $447,036.99
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CITY OF AURORA, ILLINOIS

CONTACT INFORMATION

Vendor shall provide the following contact information assigned to service the City of Aurora
account.

Customer Service/General Information: Ph:630-376-5587

To place an order:

Name:_Adam Morrison
Ph:_630-376-5587_ Fax:
E-mail: adam.morrison@graybar.com

Billing & Invoicing questions:

Name: Debi Kane
Ph: 630-671-6285 Fax:

E-mail: debi.kane@graybar.com

Questions:

Name:_Adam Morrison
Ph:_630-376-5587_ Fax:
E-mail: adam.morrison@graybar.com

Bidder’s Name: Adam Morrison___

[ Lam Marvison,

Signature & Date: 2/11/2026
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City of Aurora, IL - Local Vendor Preference Application

The business identified below is requesting to be placed on the City of Aurora, Illinois Local Vendor Preference
list, in accordance with ordinance 020-029 approved April 28, 2020.

1) Date Submitted:
2) Name of Business:
3) Address of Local Office:
4) City, State, Zip:
5) Company’s Web Address:
6) Phone: Fax:
7) County your Local Business is Located In:

Submitted By (Signature):

Print Name and Title:

Email Address:

Sec. 2-410.-Prequalification; local bidder.

(@) If an interested business would like to prequalify as a "local business", such a business shall complete and submit the
prequalification application along with supporting documentation, as listed below, and the applicable fee as set by the
City Council, to the Finance Department:

a. Evidence that the business has established and maintained a physical presence in the City of Aurora, by virtue of
the ownership or lease of all or a portion of a building for a period of not less than twelve (12) consecutive months
prior to the submission of the prequalification application; and

b. Evidence demonstrating that the business is legally authorized to conduct business within the State of Illinois and
the City of Aurora, and has a business registered to operate in the City if required; and

c. Evidence that the business is not a debtor to the City of Aurora. For purposes of this subparagraph, a debtor is
defined as having outstanding fees, water bills, sales tax or_restaurant/bar tax payments that are thirty (30) days
or more past due, or has outstanding weed or nuisance abatements or liens, has failure to comply tickets or parking
tickets that are not in dispute as to their validity and are not being challenged in court or other administrative
processes.

Back up documentation for (a) a. and (a) b. must accompany this submittal or application will be rejected.

Please note for (a) c. above the City of Aurora will verify internally that your company does not have any
outstanding fees. Your company should make sure that to the best of its knowledge all bills are current.

Return completed application, with all required backup documentation to:
City of Aurora, Attn: Purchasing Division, 44 E. Downer Place, Aurora, IL 60507
Or email to: PurchasingDL @aurora.il.us

Do not write below this line: For City of Aurora use ONLY

@ a
(@) b.

@ c.

Date:

Approved: Denied:
Letter Sent: Initials:



mailto:PurchasingDL@aurora.il.us

CITY OF AURORA AGREEMENT

THIS AGREEMENT, entered on this (“Effective Date”), for the
(Services”) is entered into between the CITY OF AURORA (“City”), a municipal corporation,
located at 44 E. Downer Place, Aurora, Illinois and (“Bidder”), located at

WHEREAS, the City issued an Invitation to Bid (“ITB”) on for the
; and

WHEREAS, the Bidder submitted a Bid in response to the ITB and represents that it is ready,
willing and able to perform the Services specified in the ITB and herein as well as any additional
services agreed to and described in the Agreement; and

WHEREAS, on , the City awarded a contract to Bidder,

IN CONSIDERATION of the mutual promises and covenants herein contained, the parties
hereto do mutually agree to the following:

1. Agreement Documents.

The Agreement shall be deemed to include this document, Bidder’s response to the ITB, to the
extent it is consistent with the terms of the ITB, any other documents as agreed upon by the
parties throughout the term of this Agreement, along with any exhibits, all of which are
incorporated herein and made a part of this Agreement. In the event of a conflict between this
Agreement and any exhibit, the provisions of this Agreement shall control.

Invitation to Bid

In connection with the ITB and this Agreement, Bidder acknowledges that it has furnished and
will continue to furnish various certifications, affidavits and other information and reports, which
are incorporated herein. Bidder represents that such material and information furnished in
connection with the ITB and this Agreement is truthful and correct. Bidder shall promptly
update such material and information to be complete and accurate, as needed, to reflect changes
or events occurring after the Effective Date of this Agreement.

2. Scope of Services.

Bidder shall perform the Services listed in the Bid, attached hereto as Exhibit 1.

3. Term.
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This agreement shall remain in effect until the terms of the ITB and completion of services have
been met, unless sooner terminated in accordance with the terms contained herein, ends upon
completion of services.

4. Compensation.

Maximum Price. In accordance with the Bidder’s negotiated cost, the price for providing the
Services shall be as stated on the submitted Bid, Exhibit 2.

Schedule of Payment. The City shall pay the Bidder for the Services in accordance with the
amounts set forth in Exhibit 2, price shall remain firm for the entire contract period. The Bidder
shall be required to submit an itemized invoice as well as any supporting documentation as
required by the City. Each invoice shall be accompanied by a statement of the Bidder of the
percentage of completion of the Services through the date of the invoice. Payment shall be made
upon the basis of the approved invoices and supporting documents. The City, after inspection
and acceptance, and in consideration of the faithful performance by the Bidder, agrees to pay for
the completion of the work embraced in this Contract. Payment shall be made in accordance
with the Illinois Local Government Prompt Payment Act (50 ILCS 505/1, et. seq.) upon receipt
of the invoice.

5. Performance of Services.

Standard of Performance. Bidder shall perform all Services set forth in this Agreement, and
any other agreed documents incorporated herein, with the degree, skill, care and diligence
customarily required of a professional performing services of comparable scope, purpose and
magnitude and in conformance with the applicable professional standards. Bidder shall, at all
times, use its best efforts to assure timely and satisfactory rendering and completion of the
Services. Bidder shall ensure that Bidder and all of its employees or subcontractors performing
Services under this Agreement shall be: (i) qualified and competent in the applicable discipline
or industry; (ii) appropriate licensed as required by law; (iii) strictly comply with all City of
Aurora, State of Illinois, and applicable federal laws or regulations; (iv) strictly conform to the
terms of this Agreement. Bidder shall, at all times until the completion of the Services, remain
solely responsible for the professional and technical accuracy of all Services and deliverables
furnished, whether such services are rendered by the Bidder or others on its behalf, including,
without limitation, its subcontractors. No review, approval, acceptance, nor payment for any and
all of the Services by the City shall relieve the Bidder from the responsibilities set forth herein.

6. Termination.

Termination for Convenience. The City has the right to terminate this Agreement, in whole or
in part, for any reason or if sufficient funds have not been appropriated to cover the estimated
requirement of the Services not yet performed, by providing Bidder with sixty (60) days notice
specifying the termination date. On the date specified, this Agreement will end. If this
Agreement is terminated by the City, as provided herein, the City shall pay the Bidder only for
services performed up to the date of termination. After the termination date, Bidder has no
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further contractual claim against the City based upon this Agreement and any payment so made
to the Bidder upon termination shall be in full satisfaction for Services rendered. Bidder shall
deliver to the City all finished and unfinished documents, studies and reports and shall become
the property of the City.

7. Miscellaneous Provisions.

a. lllinois Freedom of Information Act. The Bidder acknowledges the requirements of the
Illinois Freedom of Information Act (FOIA) and agrees to comply with all requests made by the
City of Aurora for public records (as that term is defined by Section 2(c) of FOIA in the
undersigned’s possession and to provide the requested public records to the City of Aurora
within two (2) business days of the request being made by the City of Aurora. The undersigned
agrees to indemnify and hold harmless the City of Aurora from all claims, costs, penalty, losses
and injuries (including but not limited to, attorney’s fees, other professional fees, court costs
and/or arbitration or other dispute resolution costs) arising out of or relating to its failure to
provide the public records to the City of Aurora under this agreement.

b. Entire Agreement. This Agreement, along with the documents set forth in Section 1 and
incorporated by reference elsewhere in this Agreement, with consent of the parties, represents
the entire agreement between the parties with respect to the performance of the Services. No
other contracts, representations, warranties or statements, written or verbal, are binding on the
parties. This Agreement may only be amended as provided herein.

c. Consents and Approvals. The parties represent and warrant to each other that each has
obtained all the requisite consents and approvals, whether required by internal operating
procedures or otherwise, for entering into this Agreement and the undertakings contemplated
herein.

d. Counterparts. This Agreement may be executed in one or more counterparts, each of which
shall be an original, but all of which shall constitute one and the same instrument.
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CITY OF AURORA, ILLINOIS (Contractor)
SIGNATURE SIGNATURE
Jolene Coulter
FULL NAME FULL NAME
DATE SIGNED DATE SIGNED
Director of Purchasing
TITLE TITLE
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