
A Plus AJ 
Landscaping 

Aurora,IL

Beary Landscape 
Management 
Lockport, IL Tavarez & Sons Aurora, IL

List A 

2023 "As Read" Cost 380.00$                      6,600.00$                   
 $4825.00 for April/ $450 weekly 

every month after 
2023 Per Visit Cost 380.00$                      235.71$                      

      
every month after 

2024 "As Read" Cost 480.00$                      6,800.00$                   No Bid
2024 Per Vist Cost 380.00$                      242.86$                       No Bid 
2025 "As Read" Cost 580.00$                      7,000.00$                    No Bid 
2025 Per Visit Cost 580.00$                      250.00$                      No Bid

List B

2023 "As Read" Cost No Bid 2,200.00$                   
 $1345.00 for April/ $250.00 per 

visit every month after 
2023 Per Visit Cost No Bid 157.14$                      

      
visit every month after 

2024 "As Read" Cost No Bid 2,300.00$                   No Bid
2024 Per Visit Cost No Bid 164.29$                      No Bid
2025 "As Read" Cost No Bid 2,400.00$                   No Bid
2025 Per Visit Cost No Bid 171.43$                      No Bid

List C

2023 "As Read" Cost No Bid 3,600.00$                   
 $2375.00 for April/ $450.00 per 

visit every month after 
2023 Per Visit Cost No Bid 257.14$                      

      
visit every month after 

2024 "As Read" Cost No Bid 3,700.00$                   No Bid
2024 Per Visit Cost No Bid 264.29$                      No Bid
2025 "As Read" Cost No Bid 3,800.00$                   No Bid
2025 Per Visit Cost No Bid 271.43$                      No Bid

List D 

2023 "As Read" cost No Bid 2,600.00$                   
 $1090.00 for April/ $450.00 per 

visit every month after 
2023 Per Visit Cost No Bid 185.71$                      

      
visit every month after 

2024 "As Read" cost No Bid 2,700.00$                   No Bid 
2024 Per Visit Cost No Bid 192.86$                      No Bid 
2025 "As Read" cost No Bid 2,800.00$                   No Bid 
2025 Per Visit Cost No Bid 200.00$                      No Bid 

List E
2023 "As Read" Cost 600.000$                    11,800.0000$            No Bid
2023 Per Visit Cost 600.000$                    421.4300$                  No Bid
2024 "As Read" Cost 700.000$                    12,200.0000$            No Bid
2024 Per Visit Cost 700.000$                    435.7100$                  No Bid
2025 "As Read" Cost 800.000$                    12,600.0000$            No Bid
2025 Per Visit Cost 800.00$                      450.00$                      No Bid

Tree Mulch Cost Per Sq Yard Included 0.05$                          No Bid 

The City of Aurora reserves the right to reject any or all bids, to waive technicality, 
informality or irregularity in the bids received.  The City further reserves the right to 
award the bid to the lowest responsible bidder whose offer best responds in quality, 
fitness and capacity to the requirements of the proposed work or usage and therefore 
is in the best interest of the City.

CITY OF AURORA
Bid Tabulation for 23-30

Parks Landscape Maintenance
Opened 2:00 pm, March 29, 2023
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